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ESTATE & TRUST 

NOTICES 

 

FIRST PUBLICATION 
 

  ESTATE OF MARGARET L. 

SZYMBORSKI, a/k/a MARGARET LOIS 

SZYMBORSKI, late of Londonderry 

Township, Dauphin County, PA (died: July 8, 

2022) 

  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 

the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 

given to request all persons having claims 

against the decedent to make known the same to 

the Executor or attorney, and all persons 
indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 

Executor without delay. 

  Executor: James W. Szymborski, c/o Bruce J. 

Warshawsky, Esquire, Cunningham, Chernicoff 

& Warshawsky, P.C., P.O. Box 60457, 

Harrisburg, PA  17106-0457            s2-16 

     
 

  ESTATE OF MARY ANN GAYDOS, late of 

Derry Township, Dauphin County, PA (died: 

June 11, 2022) 

  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 

the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 

given to request all persons having claims 

against the decedent to make known the same to 
the Executrix or attorney, and all persons 

indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 

Executrix without delay. 

  Executrix : Christina Lewandoski, c/o Edward 

P. Seeber, Esquire, JSDC Law Offices, Suite C-

400, 555 Gettysburg Pike, Mechanicsburg, PA 

17055; 717-533-3280               s2-16 

     
 

  ESTATE OF JOYCE ANN GREEN a/k/a 

JOYCE A. GREEN, late of Susquehanna 

Township, Dauphin County, PA 

  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 

the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 

given to request all persons having claims 
against the decedent to make known the same to 

the Executrix or attorney, and all persons 

indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 

Executrix without delay. 

  Executrix: Vickie Lynn Thomas, 690 Penn 

Street, Bressler, PA 17113 

  Attorney: John B. Zonarich, Esquire, 

SkarlatosZonarich, LLC, 320 Market Street, 
Suite 600 West, Harrisburg, PA 17101       s2-16 

     

 

 

 

 

 

  ESTATE OF HELEN MARIE GRANGER 

a/k/a HELEN M. GRANGER, late of 

Middletown Borough, Dauphin County, PA 
  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 

the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 

given to request all persons having claims 

against the decedent to make known the same to 

the Co-Executors or attorney, and all persons 

indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 

Co-Executors without delay. 

  Co-Executors: John A. Correll, Jr., 527 
Wildflower Trail, Myrtle Beach, SC 29579; 

Sharyn Correll, 527 Wildflower Trail, Myrtle 

Beach, SC 29579 

  Attorney: Jennifer M. Merx, Esquire, 

SkarlatosZonarich, LLC, 320 Market Street, 

Suite 600 West, Harrisburg, PA 17101       s2-16 

     

 
  ESTATE OF MIRANDA ANN McGUIGAN 

late of Dauphin County, PA (died: August 3, 

2022) 

  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 

the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 

given to request all persons having claims 

against the decedent to make known the same to 
the Administrator or attorney, and all persons 

indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 

Administrator without delay. 

  Administrator: Dorothy A. Greeninger  

  Attorney: Morgan Cassel, Esquire, 624 North 

Front Street, Wormleysburg, PA 17043      s2-16 

     

 
  ESTATE OF MARK STEPHEN DANIEL, 

late of Steelton Borough, Dauphin County, PA 

  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 

the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 

given to request all persons having claims 

against the decedent to make known the same to 

the Administrator or attorney, and all persons 
indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 

Administrator without delay. 

  Administrator: Elena Daniel, 2421 

Massachusetts Avenue, Camp Hill, PA 17011 

  Attorney: Butler Law Firm, 1007 Mumma 

Road, Suite 101, Lemoyne, PA 17043        s2-16 

     

 
  ESTATE OF HILDA M. HOKE, late of 

Middletown, Dauphin County, PA (died: 

August 8, 2022) 

  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 

the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 

given to request all persons having claims 

against the decedent to make known the same to 

the Executor or attorney, and all persons 
indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 

Executor without delay. 

  Executor: James Titus, 4309 North Victoria 

Way, Harrisburg, PA 17112           s2-16 

     



 

  ESTATE OF DORIS C. ANDRUSS, late of 

Millersburg Borough, Dauphin County, PA 

  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 
the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 

given to request all persons having claims 

against the decedent to make known the same to 

the Executrix or attorney, and all persons 

indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 

Executrix without delay. 

  Executrix: Elizabeth A. Schlegel, 733 Paxton 

Drive, Dalmatia, PA 17017 
  Attorney: Stephen Wade Parker, Esquire, 

Etzweiler and Withers, 105 N. Front Street, 

Harrisburg, PA 17101; (717) 234-5600      s2-16 

     

 

  ESTATE OF HELEN JO FAZIO, late of 

Swatara Township, Dauphin County, PA (died: 

July 29, 2022) 
  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 

the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 

given to request all persons having claims 

against the decedent to make known the same to 

the Co-Executrixes or attorney, and all persons 

indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 

Co-Executrixes without delay. 
  Co-Executrixes: Cynthia Miskinis, 4 Harvest 

Drive, Lewistown, PA 17044; Marie Smith, 648 

West Walnut Street, Palmyra, PA 17078 

  Attorney: Jean D. Seibert, Esquire, Caldwell 

& Kearns, P.C., 3631 North Front Street, 

Harrisburg, PA 17110; (717) 232-7666      s2-16 

     

 
  ESTATE OF L. SCOTT BRANDT, late of 

Middletown Borough, Dauphin County, PA 

(died: July 10, 2022) 

  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 

the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 

given to request all persons having claims 

against the decedent to make known the same to 
the Executrix or attorney, and all persons 

indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 

Executrix without delay. 

  Executrix: Susan Bracht, 331 E Water St., 

Middletown, PA 17057 

  Attorney: Jean D. Seibert, Esquire, Caldwell 

& Kearns, PC, 3631 N. Front St., Harrisburg, PA 

17110                      s2-16 
     

 

  ESTATE OF HOWARD H. JONES a/k/a 

HOWARD HOUSTON JONES, late of the 

City of Harrisburg, Dauphin County, PA 

  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 

the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 

given to request all persons having claims 
against the decedent to make known the same to 

the Executor or attorney, and all persons 

indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 

Executor without delay. 

  Executor: Kevin R. Leitzel, 701 South Front 

Street, Harrisburg, PA 17104 

  Attorney: David R. Getz, Esquire, Wix, 

Wenger & Weidner, 508 North Second Street, 
Harrisburg, PA 17101-1002; (717) 234-4182 

s2-16 

     

 

  ESTATE OF RINDY LOUISE AUTREY 

a/k/a RINDY LOUISE HARTZELL 

AUTREY a/k/a RINDY LOUISE 

HARTZELL, of Lower Paxton Township, 
Dauphin County, PA 

  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 

the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 

given to request all persons having claims 

against the decedent to make known the same to 

the Executrix or attorney, and all persons 

indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 

Executrix without delay. 
  Executrix: Shannon Shaffner 

  Attorney: Ryan A. Webber, Esquire, 

WEBBER LAW, PLLC, 5000 Ritter Road, 

Suite 202, Mechanicsburg, PA 17055; (717) 

790-2410             s2-16 

     

 
  ESTATE OF DONALD H. SMITH, late of 

Susquehanna Township, Dauphin County, PA 

  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 

the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 

given to request all persons having claims 

against the decedent to make known the same to 

the Administrator or attorney, and all persons 

indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 
Administrator without delay. 

  Administrator: Nicholas M. Smith, c/o Craig 

A. Hatch, Esquire, Halbruner, Hatch & Guise, 

LLP, 2109 Market Street, Camp Hill, PA 17011 

s2-16 

     

 
  ESTATE OF BARBARA J. CROW, late of 

Susquehanna Township, Dauphin County, PA. 

  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 

the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 

given to request all persons having claims 

against the decedent to make known the same to 

the Executrix or attorney, and all persons 

indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 
Executrix without delay. 

  Executrix: Pamela K. Ora 

  Attorney: Jessica Fisher Greene, Esquire, 

WALTERS & GALLOWAY, PLLC, 39 West 

Main Street, Mechanicsburg, PA 17055     s2-16 

     

 

  ESTATE OF DOUGLAS PLATT, late of 
West Hanover Township, Dauphin County, PA    

(died: January 3, 2022) 

  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 

the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 

given to request all persons having claims 



 

against the decedent to make known the same to 

the Executor or attorney, and all persons 

indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 
Executor without delay. 

  Executor: Timothy Platt, 3206 Meadow Lane, 

Harrisburg, PA 17109            s2-16 

     

 

  ESTATE OF MARIANN T. LAWRENCE, 

late of Susquehanna Township, Dauphin 

County, PA (died: December 9, 2021) 
  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 

the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 

given to request all persons having claims 

against the decedent to make known the same to 

the Executor or attorney, and all persons 

indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 

Executor without delay. 

  Executor: John T. Lawrence, 7211 Evergreen 
Lane, Harrisburg PA 17112 

  Attorney: Michael J. Wilson, Esquire, 113 

Iron Furnace Court, Lewisberry, PA 17339-

9339             s2-16 

     

 

  ESTATE OF TIMOTHY R. SWIGART, 
late of South Hanover Township, Dauphin 

County, PA (died: April 22, 2022) 

  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 

the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 

given to request all persons having claims 

against the decedent to make known the same to 

the Executor or attorney, and all persons 

indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 
Executor without delay. 

  Executor: Andrew R. Swigart, 16 Willow 

Ridge, Elizabethtown, PA 17022 

  Attorney: Michael J. Wilson, Esquire, 113 

Iron Furnace Court, Lewisberry, PA 17339-

9339             s2-16 

     

 

SECOND PUBLICATION 
 

  ESTATE OF JANET K. RHOADS, late of  

Hummelstown Borough, Dauphin County, PA 

  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 

the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 

given to request all persons having claims 

against the decedent to make known the same to 

the Executor or attorney, and all persons 
indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 

Executor without delay. 

  Executor: The Bryn Mawr Trust Company, 

One East Chocolate Ave., Suite 200, Hershey, 

PA 17033 

  Attorney: Keven Koscil, Esquire, Barley 

Snyder, 213 Market Street, 12th Floor, 

Harrisburg, PA 17101            a26-s9 
     

 

  ESTATE OF EVELYN E. REINFELD a/k/a 

EVELYN ELLA REINFELD, late of Middle 

Paxton Township, Dauphin County, PA (died: 
July 24, 2022) 

  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 

the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 

given to request all persons having claims 

against the decedent to make known the same to 

the Executrix or attorney, and all persons 

indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 

Executrix without delay. 
  Executrix: Deborah R. Yeakle, 950 Peters 

Mountain Road, Dauphin, PA 17018 

  Attorney: Gregory M. Kerwin, Esquire, 

Kerwin & Kerwin, LLP, 4245 State Route 209, 

Elizabethville, PA 17023          a26-s9 

     

 

  ESTATE OF LINDA L. JACKMAN, late of 
Dauphin County, PA 

  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 

the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 

given to request all persons having claims 

against the decedent to make known the same to 

the Executor or attorney, and all persons 

indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 
Executor without delay. 

  Executor: Jack L. Shiley, Executor, c/o 

Nicholas O. Schwartz, Esquire, Allied Attorneys 

of Central Pennsylvania, LLC, 61 West Louther 

St., Carlisle, PA 17013           a26-s9 

     

 

  ESTATE OF JANET B. HAMILTON, a/k/a 

JANET LEONE HAMILTON, late of 

Susquehanna Township, Dauphin County, PA 

(died: May 21, 2022) 

  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 

the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 

given to request all persons having claims 

against the decedent to make known the same to 
the Executrix or attorney, and all persons 

indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 

Executrix without delay. 

  Executrix: Debra L. Mittiga, 2017 Sauers 

Road, Harrisburg, PA 17110 

  Attorney: Jacqueline Kelly, Esquire, JSDC 

Law Offices, 11 East Chocolate Avenue, Suite 

300, Hershey, PA 17033; (717) 533-3280  
a26-s9 

     

 

  ESTATE OF GRACEANN P. BECHTOLD, 

late of Steelton, Dauphin County, PA (died: 

April 2, 2022) 

  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 

the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 
given to request all persons having claims 

against the decedent to make known the same to 

the Executrix or attorney, and all persons 

indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 

Executrix without delay. 



 

  Executrix: Geralynne Nolan, 6103 Mayfair 

Drive, Harrisburg, PA 17112 

  Attorney: Jacqueline Kelly, Esquire, JSDC 
Law Offices, 11 East Chocolate Avenue, Suite 

300, Hershey, PA 17033; (717) 533-3280  

a26-s9 

     

 

  ESTATE OF RITA MARIE DAVIS 

BRUNNER, late of Dauphin County, PA 

  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 
the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 

given to request all persons having claims 

against the decedent to make known the same to 

the Executor or attorney, and all persons 

indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 

Executor without delay. 

  Executor:  Robert L. Davis, 6116 Smithfield 

Street, Harrisburg, PA 17112          a26-s9 
     

 

  ESTATE OF JOAN E. HELT, late of Halifax 

Township, Dauphin County, PA 

  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 

the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 

given to request all persons having claims 
against the decedent to make known the same to 

the Co-Executors or attorney, and all persons 

indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 

Co-Executors without delay. 

  Co-Executors: Steve C. Helt, 401 Maple 

Street, Halifax, PA 17032; Dennis E. Helt, 12 

Del View Drive, Halifax, PA 17032 

  Attorney: Andrew S. Withers, Esquire, 
Etzweiler and Withers, 105 N. Front Street, 

Harrisburg, PA 17101; (717) 234-5600    a26-s9 

     

 

  ESTATE OF BARRY R. GOOD, late of 

Washington Township, Dauphin County, PA 

(died: July 22, 2020) 
  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 

the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 

given to request all persons having claims 

against the decedent to make known the same to 

the Administratrix or attorney, and all persons 

indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 

Administratrix without delay. 

  Administratrix: Melissa Gaus, 10 Small 
Valley Road, Halifax, PA 17032 

  Attorney: Elizabeth H. Feather, Esquire, 

Caldwell & Kearns, P.C., 3631 North Front 

Street, Harrisburg, PA 17110; (717) 901-5948 

a26-s9 

     

 

  ESTATE OF MARLIN T. WILBERT, late 
of Halifax Township, Dauphin County, PA 

(died: July 22, 2022) 

  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 

the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 

given to request all persons having claims 

against the decedent to make known the same to 

the Executor or attorney, and all persons 

indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 
Executor without delay. 

  Executor: Matthew J. Wilbert, 40 Cornfield 

Road, Halifax, PA 17032 

  Attorney: Gregory M. Kerwin, Esquire, 

Kerwin & Kerwin, LLP, 4245 State Route 209, 

Elizabethville, PA 17023          a26-s9 

     

 
  ESTATE OF JEFFREY P. DUNN, JR., late 

of Derry Township, Dauphin County, PA (died: 

January 13, 2022)  

  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 

the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 

given to request all persons having claims 

against the decedent to make known the same to 

the Administrator or attorney, and all persons 
indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 

Administrator without delay. 

  Administrator: Christopher D. Cvijic, c/o 

Heather A. Printz, Esq., Printz Law, 51 West 

End Trail, Box 424, Macungie, PA 18062 

  Attorney: Heather A. Printz, Esq., Printz Law, 

51 West End Trail, Box 424, Macungie, PA 
18062           a26-s9 

     

 

  ESTATE OF DAWN SCHRAMM, late of 

Middletown Borough, Dauphin County, PA 

  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 

the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 

given to request all persons having claims 
against the decedent to make known the same to 

the Executor or attorney, and all persons 

indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 

Executor without delay. 

  Executor: Thomas G. Schramm, Jr. 

  Attorney: Thomas L. McGlaughlin, Esquire, 

MBA, Northstar Legal Services, LLC, 6106 
Schoolhouse Road, Elizabethtown, PA 17022 

a26-s9 

     

 

THIRD PUBLICATION 
 

  ESTATE OF PHYLLIS JEAN HUFF, late 

of Lower Paxton Township, Dauphin County, 

PA 

  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 
the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 

given to request all persons having claims 

against the decedent to make known the same to 

the Executor or attorney, and all persons 

indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 

Executor without delay. 

  Executor: B. Mark Constable, c/o George W. 

Porter, Esquire, 909 East Chocolate Avenue, 
Hershey, PA 17033                                   a19-s2 

     



 

  ESTATE OF YOLANDA D. BARLEY, late 

of Derry Township, Dauphin County, PA (died: 

June 10, 2022) 
  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 

the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 

given to request all persons having claims 

against the decedent to make known the same to 

the Executor or attorney, and all persons 

indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 

Executor without delay. 

  Executor:  Richard Barley, 29 Maple Avenue, 
Hershey, PA 17033 

  Attorney: A. Mark Winter, Esquire, JSDC 

Law Offices, 11 East Chocolate Avenue, Suite 

300, Hershey, PA 17033; (717) 533-3280   

a19-s2 

     

 

  ESTATE OF DONALD A. CALE, late of 
Hershey, Derry Township, Dauphin County, PA 

(died: April 30, 2022) 

  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 

the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 

given to request all persons having claims 

against the decedent to make known the same to 

the Executor or attorney, and all persons 
indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 

Executor without delay. 

  Executor: Ronald L. Cale, 703 Rowe Lane, 

Harrisburg, PA 17112 

  Attorney: Jacqueline Kelly, Esquire, JSDC 

Law Offices, 11 East Chocolate Avenue, Suite 

300, Hershey, PA 17033; (717) 533-3280  

a19-s2 
     

 

  ESTATE OF MAUREEN ELIZABETH 

BRENNAN-WEAVER, late of Harrisburg 

City, Dauphin County, PA (died: June 14, 2022) 

  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 

the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 
given to request all persons having claims 

against the decedent to make known the same to 

the Administratrix c.t.a. or attorney, and all 

persons indebted to the decedent to make 

payment to the Administratrix c.t.a. without 

delay. 

  Administratrix c.t.a.: Caitleen Brennan Weaver,  

1122 S. Plata Circle, Santa Fe, NM  87501 
  Attorney: Christa M. Aplin, Esquire, JSDC 

Law Offices, 11 East Chocolate Avenue, Suite 

300, Hershey, PA  17033;  (717) 533-3280  

a19-s2 

     

 

  ESTATE OF DYRLE ALBERTS, late of 

Halifax, Dauphin County, PA (died: July 8, 
2022) 

  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 

the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 

given to request all persons having claims 

against the decedent to make known the same to 

the Executrix or attorney, and all persons 

indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 

Executrix without delay. 
  Executrix:  LeeAnn Alberts, 101 Small Valley 

Road, Halifax, PA 17032 

  Attorney: Joanne M. Sanderson, P.O. Box 

306, Duncannon, PA 17020                      a19-s2 

     

 

  ESTATE OF LLOYD P. BLAKE, late of 

Miller Township, Perry County, PA 
  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 

the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 

given to request all persons having claims 

against the decedent to make known the same to 

the Executrix or attorney, and all persons 

indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 

Executrix without delay. 

  Executrix: Pamela S. Eisenhour 
  Attorney: David R. Galloway, Esquire, 

WALTERS & GALLOWAY, PLLC, 39 West 

Main Street, Mechanicsburg, PA 17055   a19-s2 

     

 

  ESTATE OF JOSEPHINE A. WINGER 

a/k/a JOSEPHINE ANNE WINGER, late of 
Susquehanna Township, Dauphin County, PA  

  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 

the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 

given to request all persons having claims 

against the decedent to make known the same to 

the Executrix or attorney, and all persons 

indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 

Executrix without delay. 
  Executrix: Donna Winger Mowery  

  Attorney: Melanie Walz Scaringi, Esquire, 

Scaringi Law, 2000 Linglestown Rd., Suite 106, 

Harrisburg, PA 17110                               a19-s2 

     

 

  ESTATE OF CHRISTINA E. BROWN 

a/k/a CHRISTINA BROWN, late of West 

Hanover Township, Dauphin County, PA 

  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 

the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 

given to request all persons having claims 

against the decedent to make known the same to 

the Executor or attorney, and all persons 

indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 
Executor without delay. 

  Executor: Charles O. Hock, c/o Sean M. 

Shultz, Esquire, Saidis, Shultz & Fisher, 100 

Sterling Parkway, Suite 300, Mechanicsburg, 

PA 17050 

  Attorney: Sean M. Shultz, Esquire, SAIDIS, 

SHULTZ & FISHER, 100 Sterling Parkway, 

Suite 300, Mechanicsburg, PA 17050; (717) 
590-8529                                                    a19-s2 

     

 

 

 



 

  ESTATE OF DOROTHY O. NEUBAUM, 

a/k/a DOROTHY OLIVE NEUBAUM, late of 

Upper Township, Dauphin County, PA 
  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 

the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 

given to request all persons having claims 

against the decedent to make known the same to 

the Co-Executrices or attorney, and all persons 

indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 

Co-Executrices without delay. 

  Co-Executrices: Sharon D. Roberts, 503 
Winey Avenue, Middleburg, PA 17842; Denise 

A. Bailey, 3635 Surrey Drive, York, PA 17406 

  Attorney: Earl Richard Etzweiler, Esquire, 

Etzweiler and Withers, 105 N. Front Street, 

Harrisburg, PA 17101; (717) 234-5600    a19-s2 

     

 

FIRST PUBLICATION 

 

CORPORATE NOTICES 
 
  NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that C2 

Construction SBC Inc., a foreign corporation 

formed under the laws of the State of Florida and 

its principal office is located at 1982 State Rd. 

44, #355, New Smyrna Beach, FL 32168, has 

registered to do business in Pennsylvania with 

the Department of State of the Commonwealth 

of Pennsylvania, at Harrisburg, PA, on 8/9/22, 
under the provisions of  Chapter 4 of the 

Association Transactions Act. 

  The registered office in Pennsylvania shall be 

deemed for venue and official publication 

purposes to be located in Dauphin County.        s2 

     

 

  NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN GRAD 

CONCEPT INC., a foreign business 

corporation incorporated under the laws of 

Delaware, with its princ. office located at 990 

Biscayne Blvd., Office 701, Miami, FL 33132, 

has applied for a Statement of Registration to do 

business in Pennsylvania under the provisions of 

Chapter 4 of the Association Transactions Act. 
The street address in the association’s 

jurisdiction of formation is 251 Little Falls Dr., 

Wilmington, DE 19808. The commercial 

registered office provider in PA is c/o: 

Corporation Service Co., and shall be deemed 

for venue and official publication purposes to be 

located in Dauphin County.                s2 

     
 

  NOTICE IS  HEREBY GIVEN EcoAct, Inc., 

a foreign business corporation incorporated 

under the laws of Delaware, with its princ. office 

located at 4851 Regent Blvd., Irving, TX 75063, 

has applied for a Statement of Registration to do 

business in Pennsylvania under the provisions of 

Chapter 4 of the Association Transactions Act. 

The commercial registered office provider in PA 

is c/o: Corporation Service Co., and shall be 
deemed for venue and official publication 

purposes to be located in Dauphin County.        s2 

     

  

  NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that pursuant to 

the applicable provisions of 15 Pa.C.S Section 

415 or 417, BHS MANAGEMENT 

SERVICES, INC., a corporation incorporated 
under the laws of the State of Massachusetts 

with its registered office in PA at 2595 Interstate 

Dr., Ste. 103, Harrisburg, PA 17110, Dauphin 

County, intends to file a Statement of 

Withdrawal of Foreign Registration with the 

Dept. of State.                 s2 

     

 
  NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that Articles of 

Incorporation have been filed with the 

Department of the Commonwealth of 

Pennsylvania on 8/22/2022 under the Domestic 

Business Corporation Law, for 

NERTHLING’S HEATING AND AIR 

CONDITIONING HOLDINGS, INC., and the 
name and county of the commercial registered 

office provider is c/o: Corporation Service Co., 

Dauphin County.                 s2 

     

 

  NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN PROCare HR 

Corporation II, a foreign business corporation 

incorporated under the laws of Minnesota, with 
its princ. office located at 401 N. 3rd St., Ste. 

600, Minneapolis, MN 55401, has applied for a 

Statement of Registration to do business in 

Pennsylvania under the provisions of Chapter 4 

of the Association Transactions Act. The street 

address in the association’s jurisdiction of 

formation is 401 N. 3rd St., Ste. 600, 
Minneapolis, MN 55401. The commercial 

registered office provider in PA is c/o: 

Corporation Service Co., and shall be deemed 

for venue and official publication purposes to be 

located in Dauphin County.                s2 

     

 

  NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that Articles of 
Incorporation were filed with the Department of 

State of the Commonwealth of Pennsylvania on 

August 10, 2022 with respect to a proposed non-

profit corporation Steelton Historical Society 

which has been incorporated under the nonprofit 

Corporation Law of 1988. 

  A brief summary of the purposes for which said 

corporation is organized is: collecting and 
preserving objects pertaining to the history of 

the Borough of Steelton, and promote an 

appreciation of the Borough’s history. 

 

s2         Attorney: Michael L. Solomon, Esquire 



 

  NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that FedEx 

Dataworks, Inc., a foreign corporation formed 

under the laws of the State of Delaware and its 
principal office is located at 942 South Shady 

Grove Road, Memphis, TN 38120, has 

registered to do business in Pennsylvania with 

the Department of State of the Commonwealth 

of Pennsylvania, at Harrisburg, PA, on 7/7/22, 

under the provisions of  Chapter 4 of the 

Association Transactions Act. 

  The registered office in Pennsylvania shall be 
deemed for venue and official publication 

purposes to be located in Dauphin County.        s2 

     

 

  NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that Industrial 

Dynamics Company, Ltd., a foreign 

corporation formed under the laws of the State 

of California and its principal office is located at 
3100 Fujita St., Torrance, CA 90505, has 

registered to do business in Pennsylvania with 

the Department of State of the Commonwealth 

of Pennsylvania, at Harrisburg, PA, on 8/17/22, 

under the provisions of  Chapter 4 of the 

Association Transactions Act. 

  The registered office in Pennsylvania shall be 
deemed for venue and official publication 

purposes to be located in Dauphin County.        s2 

     

 

  NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that a Foreign 

Registration Statement has been filed with the 

Department of State of the Commonwealth of 

Pennsylvania, at Harrisburg, PA on or about 
08/11/2022, for a foreign corporation by the 

name of and with a registered address in the 

Commonwealth of Pennsylvania as follows: US 

BUS CHARTER & LIMO INC. c/o 

Registered Agent Solutions, Inc. its commercial 

registered office provider. 

  This corporation is incorporated under the laws 
of the state of New Jersey. 

  The address of its principal office is 960 

Holmdel Road, Holmdel, NJ 07733. 

  The corporation has been registered in 

Pennsylvania under the provisions of the 

Business Corporation Law of 1988, as amended. 

s2 

     
 

  NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that pursuant to 

the applicable provisions of 15 Pa.C.S Section 

415 or 417, CFO LEADERSHIP COUNCIL, 

INC., a corporation incorporated under the laws 

of the State of Delaware with its registered 

office in PA at c/o: Corporation Service Co., 

Dauphin County, intends to file a Statement of 
Withdrawal of Foreign Registration with the 

Dept. of State.                 s2 

     

 

 

  NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN AGREEYA 

HEALTHCARE INC. filed a Foreign 

Registration Statement with the Commonwealth 
of Pennsylvania. The address of its principal 

office under the laws of its jurisdiction is 605 

Coolidge Dr., Ste. 200 Folsom, CA 95630. The 

Commercial Registered Office Provider is URS 

AGENTS, LLC in the county of Dauphin. The 

Corporation is filed in compliance with the 

requirements of the applicable provision of 15 

Pa. C.S. 412.                  s2 
     

  

  NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN Think 

Common Films, Inc. filed a Foreign 

Registration Statement with the Commonwealth 

of Pennsylvania. The address of its principal 

office under the laws of its jurisdiction is 15821 

Ventura Blvd., Suite 370 Encino, California 
91436. The Commercial Registered Office 

Provider is eResidentAgent, Inc. in the county of 

Dauphin. The Corporation is filed in compliance 

with the requirements of the applicable 

provision of 15 Pa. C.S. 412.                 s2 

     

 
  NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN Bubble 

Group, Inc. filed a Foreign Registration 

Statement with the Commonwealth of 

Pennsylvania. The address of its principal office 

under the laws of its jurisdiction is 22 West 21st 

St., 3rd Fl., New York, New York 10010. The 

Commercial Registered Office Provider is 

Vcorp Services, LLC in the county of Dauphin. 
The Corporation is filed in compliance with the 

requirements of the applicable provision of 15 

Pa. C.S. 412.                  s2 

     

 

  NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that Articles of 

Incorporation - For Profit have been filed with 
the Department of State of the Commonwealth 

of Pennsylvania, at Harrisburg, PA on 

08/11/2022, for: The PPF Foundation Inc. 

having a registered office address of c/o 

ZenBusiness Inc. its commercial registered 

office provider. 

  The corporation has been incorporated under 

the provisions of the Pennsylvania Business 
Corporation Law of 1988, as amended.               s2 

     

 

  NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that FIGS, 

Inc., foreign corporation formed under the laws 

of the State of Delaware and its principal office 

is located at 2834 Colorado Ave., Ste. 100, Santa 

Monica, CA 90404, has registered to do business 
in Pennsylvania with the Department of State of 

the Commonwealth of Pennsylvania, at 

Harrisburg, PA, on 7/6/22, under the provisions 

of  Chapter 4 of the Association Transactions 

Act. 



 

  The registered office in Pennsylvania shall be 

deemed for venue and official publication 

purposes to be located in Dauphin County.        s2 
     

 

  NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN IVESIA 

SOLUTIONS, INC., a foreign business 

corporation incorporated under the laws of 

Delaware, with its princ. office located at 45 

Stiles Rd., Ste. 211, Salem, MA 03079, has 

applied for a Statement of Registration to do 
business in Pennsylvania under the provisions of 

Chapter 4 of the Association Transactions Act. 

The commercial registered office provider in PA 

is c/o: Corporation Service Co., and shall be 

deemed for venue and official publication 

purposes to be located in Dauphin County.        s2 

     

 
  NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN Med-Vantage, 

Inc., a foreign business corporation 

incorporated under the laws of Delaware, with 

its princ. office located at 425 Market St., 7th Fl., 

San Francisco, CA 94105, has applied for a 

Statement of Registration to do business in 

Pennsylvania under the provisions of Chapter 4 
of the Association Transactions Act. The 

commercial registered office provider in PA is 

c/o: Corporation Service Co., and shall be 

deemed for venue and official publication 

purposes to be located in Dauphin County.        s2 

     

 

  NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that Articles of 
Incorporation have been filed with the 

Department of the Commonwealth of 

Pennsylvania on 8/24/2022 under the Domestic 

Business Corporation Law, for Jeffrey Zudeck, 

CPA, P.C., and the name and county of the 

commercial registered office provider is c/o: 

Corporation Service Co., Dauphin County.       s2 
     

 

  NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that Jera 

Americas Inc., a foreign corporation formed 

under the laws of the State of Delaware and its 

principal office is located at 1000 Main, Ste. 

3100, Houston, TX 77002, has registered to do 

business in Pennsylvania with the Department of 
State of the Commonwealth of Pennsylvania, at 

Harrisburg, PA, on 8/19/22, under the 

provisions of  Chapter 4 of the Association 

Transactions Act. 

  The registered office in Pennsylvania shall be 

deemed for venue and official publication 

purposes to be located in Dauphin County.        s2 

     
 

  NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that Last Mile 

Solution, Inc. has filed a Certificate of 

Incorporation on August 15, 2022 in the 

Commonwealth of Pennsylvania under the 

provisions of the Pennsylvania Business 

Corporation Law of 1988.                s2 

  NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that Tormach, 

Inc., a foreign corporation formed under the 

laws of the State of Wisconsin and its principal 

office is located at 6580 Monona Drive, Suite 

1014, Monona, WI 53716, has registered to do 

business in Pennsylvania with the Department of 

State of the Commonwealth of Pennsylvania, at 

Harrisburg, PA, on 7/13/22, under the 

provisions of  Chapter 4 of the Association 
Transactions Act. 

  The registered office in Pennsylvania shall be 

deemed for venue and official publication 

purposes to be located in Dauphin County.        s2 

     

 

  NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that Articles of 

Incorporation were filed with the Department of 
State of the Commonwealth of Pennsylvania on 

July 5, 2022 with respect to a proposed non-

profit corporation Cocoa Kitties which has been 

incorporated under the non-profit Corporation 

Law of 1988. 

  A brief summary of the purposes for which said 

corporation is organized is: rescue, 
rehabilitation, spay/neuter, adoption.                   s2 

     

 

  NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that a Foreign 

Registration Statement has been filed with the 

Department of State of the Commonwealth of 

Pennsylvania, at Harrisburg, PA on or about 

August 10, 2022, for a foreign corporation with 
a registered address in the state of Pennsylvania 

as follows: DOCUSMART INC. c/o Registered 

Agent Solutions, Inc. 

  This corporation is incorporated under the laws 

of Delaware. 

  The address of its principal office is 113 Cherry 

Street, PMB 65390, Seattle, WA 98104. 
  The corporation has been qualified in 

Pennsylvania under the provisions of the 

Business Corporation Law of 1988, as amended. 

               s2 

     

 

FICTITIOUS NAME 

NOTICES 
 

  NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that an 

Application for Registration of Fictitious Name 
was filed in the Department of State of the 

Commonwealth of Pennsylvania on July 12, 

2022 for Queue Therapeutic Massage at 3211 

N 4th St., Harrisburg, PA 17110. The name and 

address of each individual interested in the 

business is Quinton Loper at 3211 N 4th St., 

Harrisburg, PA 17110. This was filed in 
accordance with 54 Pa.C.S. 311.417.                    s2 



 

  NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that a 

Registration of Fictitious Name was filed in the 

Commonwealth of Pennsylvania for 
HomeHunt with a principal place of business 

located at 600 N. 2nd St., 4th Floor, Harrisburg, 

PA 17101 in Dauphin County. 

  The individual interested in this business is 

Joseph Panebianco with an address of 700 East 

Gate Drive, #400, Mt. Laurel, NJ 08054.  

  The entity interested in this business is 

Analytical Sciences Marketing Group LLC with 
an address also at 700 East Gate Dr., #400, Mt. 

Laurel, NJ 08054 and with a commercial 

registered office provider in care of Penncorp 

Servicegroup, Inc. in Dauphin County. This is 

filed in compliance with 54 Pa.C.S. 311.             s2 

     

 

MISCELLENOUS 

NOTICES 
 

IN THE COURT OF COMMON PLEAS 

OF DAUPHIN COUNTY 

PENNSYLVANIA 

 

DOCKET NO. 2022-CV-2953-EJ 

 

U.S. BANK NATIONAL ASSOCIATION 

AS LEGAL TITLE TRUSTEE FOR 

TRUMAN 2016 SC6 TITLE TRUST, 

PLAINTIFF 

VS.  

BELLE CHERI ELIZABETH FUNK, ET 

AL, DEFENDANT 

 

To: Belle Cheri Elizabeth Funk and all 

occupants of the realty commonly known as 235 
East Water Street, Middletown, PA 17057.  

 

  YOU HAVE BEEN SUED in Court. If you 

wish to defend against the claims set forth in the 

Complaint in Ejectment, you must take action 

within twenty (20) days after this publication, by 

entering a written appearance personally or by 
attorney and filing in writing with the Court your 

defenses or objections to the claims set forth 

against you in the complaint. You are warned 

that if you fail to do so, the case may proceed 

without you and a judgment may be entered 

against you by the Court without further notice. 

You may lose rights you believe important to 

you.  
  YOU SHOULD TAKE this publication to your 

lawyer at once. If you do not have a lawyer, go 

to or telephone the office set forth below. This 

office can provide you with information about 

hiring a lawyer.  

  IF YOU CANNOT AFFORD to hire a lawyer, 

this office may be able to provide you with 
information about agencies that may offer legal 

services to eligible persons at a reduced fee or 

no fee.  

 
Dauphin County Bar Association 

Lawyer Referral Service 

213 North Front Street 

Harrisburg, PA 17101 

717-232-7536 

 

Romano, Garubo & Argentieri, LLC 

Attorneys for Plaintiff 
52 Newton Ave. 

Woodbury, NJ 08096 

s2                 856-384-1515 

     

 

IN THE COURT OF COMMON PLEAS 

OF CUMBERLAND COUNTY, 

PENNSYLVANIA 

 

NO. 2022-03468 

 

CIVIL ACTION – DIVORCE 

 

OLUSEGUN ELISHA GBEWESA, 

PLAINTIFF 

VS.    

TERESA YVETTEE GBEWESA , Defendant 

 

PUBLICATION NOTICE 

 

  NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that a 

Complaint for Divorce has been filed in the 

Court of Common Pleas of Cumberland County, 
Pennsylvania, in the above matter. 

 

NOTICE 

 

  IF YOU WISH TO DEFEND, you must enter 

a written appearance personally or by attorney 

and file your defenses or objections in writing 
with the court. You are warned that if you fail to 

do so the case may proceed without you and a 

judgment may be entered against you without 

further notice for the relief requested by the 

plaintiff. You may lose money or property or 

other rights important to you. 

  YOU SHOULD TAKE THIS PAPER TO 

YOUR LAQYER AT ONCE. IF YOU DO NOT 
HAVE A LAWYER, GO TO OR TELEPONE 

THE OFFICE SET FORTH BELOW. THIS 

OFFICE CAN PROVIDE YOU WITH 

INFORMATION ABOUT HIRING A 

LAWYER. 

  IF YOU CANNOT AFFORD TO HIRE A 

LAWYER, THIS OFFICE MAY BE ABLE TO 

PROVIDE YOU WITH INFORMATION 
ABOUT AGENCIES THAT MAY OFFER 

LEGAL SERVICES TO ELGIBLE PERSONS 

AT A REDUCED FEE OR NO FEE. 

 

Mid Penn Legal Services 



 

401 East Louther Street, Suite 103 

Carlisle, PA 17013 

717-243-0826 
               s2 

     

 

NOTICE OF FILING  

ARTICLES OF AMENDMENT 

 

  NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that on or about 

September 1, 2022 The Gratz Bank (“Bank”), 
with its principal place of business located 32 

West Market Street, Gratz, Dauphin County, 

Pennsylvania, filed Articles of Amendment with 

the Pennsylvania Department of Banking and 

Securities pursuant to the provisions of Chapter 

15 of the Banking Code of 1965, as amended.  

  THE PURPOSE of the amendment is:  

  1) to relocate the Bank’s main office from 32 
West Market Street, Gratz, Dauphin County, 

Pennsylvania to 3045 Market Street, Camp Hill, 

Cumberland County, Pennsylvania. The Bank 

intends to retain its location at Gratz, Dauphin 

County, Pennsylvania as a branch location of the 

Bank; and  

  2) to change the Bank’s name from “The Gratz 
Bank” to “LINKBANK”.  

  ALL INTERESTED PERSONS may file 

comments regarding this amendment, in writing, 

with the Pennsylvania Department of Banking 

and Securities, Corporate Applications Division, 

17 North Second Street, Suite 1300, Harrisburg, 

PA 17101-2290.  

  IN ORDER TO be considered, comments 
regarding this amendment must be received by 

the Department of Banking and Securities no 

later than thirty (30) days after the date that 

notice of the filing of this amendment is 

published in the Pennsylvania Bulletin. 

Publication in the Pennsylvania Bulletin may or 

may not appear contemporaneously with this 
notice. Please check the Pennsylvania Bulletin 

Web site at www.pabulletin.com to determine 

the due date for filing comments.                s2 

     

 

IN THE COURT OF COMMON PLEAS 

OF DAUPHIN COUNTY, 

PENNSYLVANIA 

 

NO. 2021-CV-8904-DV 

 

CIVIL ACTION LAW 

 

IN DIVORCE 

 

GLENN L. BLAND, PLAINTIFF 

VS. 

SARAH C. FRANCIS, DEFENDANT 

 

NOTICE 

 

  IF YOU WISH to deny any of the statements 

set forth in this affidavit, you must file a counter-

affidavit within 20 days after this affidavit has 
been served on you or the statements will be 

admitted. 

 

AFFIDAVIT UNDER SECTION 3301(d) 

OF THE DIVORCE CODE 

 

  1. THE PARTIES to this action separated on 

March 13, 2022 (per Wife) OR August 15, 2020 
(per Husband). 

  2. Check (a) or (b): 

☐(a) The date of separation was prior to 

December 5, 2016, and the parties have 

continued to live separate and apart for a 

period of at least two years. 

☒ (b) The date of separation was on or after 

December 5, 2016, and the parties have 

continued to live separate and apart for a 

period of at least one year. 
  3. The marriage is irretrievably broken. 

  4.     I understand that I may lose rights concerning 

alimony, division of property, lawyer’s fees, 

costs and expenses, or other important rights if I 

do not claim them before a divorce is granted. 

  I verify that the statements made in this 

Affidavit are true and correct. I understand that 

false statements herein are made subject to the 
penalties of 18 Pa. C.S. §4904 relating to 

unsworn falsifications to authorities. 

 

Date: July 11, 2022 

/s/ Sarah C. Francis, Defendant 

 

COUNTER-AFFIDAVIT UNDER 

SECTION 3301(d) OF THE  

DIVORCE CODE 

 

  1. Check either (a) or (b): 

 

☐ (a) I do not oppose the entry of a divorce 

decree.  

☐ (b) I oppose the entry of a divorce decree 

because: (check (i), (ii), (iii) or all): 

☐ (i) The parties to this action have not 

lived separate and apart for the required 

separation period: two years for parties 

separated prior to December 5, 2016, and 
one year for parties that separated on or 

after December 5, 2016. 

☐ (ii) The marriage is not irretrievably 

broken. 

☐ (iii) There are economic claims pending. 

  2. Check (a), (b) or (c): 

☐ (a) I do not wish to make any claims for 

economic relief. I understand that I may lose 

rights concerning alimony, division of 

property, lawyer's fees, costs and expenses, 

or other important rights if I do not claim 
them before a divorce is granted. 



 

☐ (b) I wish to claim economic relief, which 

may include alimony, division of property, 

lawyer's fees, costs and expenses, or other 

important rights. 

  I UNDERSTAND THAT IN ADDITION TO 
CHECKING (2)(b), I MUST ALSO FILE ALL 

OF MY ECONOMIC CLAIMS IN WRITING 

AND SERVE THEM ON THE OTHER 

PARTY. IF I FAIL TO DO SO BEFORE THE 

DATE SET FORTH ON THE NOTICE OF 

INTENTION TO FILE THE PRAECIPE TO 

TRANSMIT RECORD, THE DIVORCE 
DECREE OR ORDER APPROVING 

GROUNDS FOR DIVORCE MAY BE 

ENTERED WITHOUT FURTHER NOTICE 

TO ME, AND I MAY BE UNABLE 

THEREAFTER TO FILE ANY ECONOMIC 

CLAIMS. 

☐ (c) Economic claims have been raised and 

are not resolved. 

  I verify that the statements made in this 
counter-affidavit are true and correct. I 

understand that false statements herein are made 

subject to the penalties of 18 Pa.C.S. §4904 

relating to unsworn falsification to authorities. 

 

Date:               Glenn L. Bland 

 

NOTICE 
 

  IF YOU DO NOT WISH TO OPPOSE THE 

ENTRY OF A DIVORCE DECREE OR 

ORDER APPROVING GROUNDS FOR 

DIVORCE AND YOU DO NOT WISH TO 

MAKE ANY CLAIM FOR ECONOMIC 

RELIEF, YOU SHOULD NOT FILE THIS 

COUNTER-AFFIDAVIT. 
 

CERTIFICATE OF COMPLIANCE 

 

  I certify that this filing complies with the 

provisions of the Case Records Public Access 

Policy of the Unified Judicial System of 

Pennsylvania that require filing confidential 
information and documents differently than 

non-confidential information and documents. 

 

Respectfully submitted, 

McNEES WALLACE & NURICK LLC 

J. Paul Helvy 

I.D. No. 53148 

Dated: 7/12/2022 
 

CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE 

 

  The undersigned hereby certifies that on this 

date a true and correct copy of the foregoing 

document was served by email and Certified 

Mail upon the following: 

 
Brittany R. Gardner, Esquire 

GARDNER LAW GROUP 

1117 Ivy Hill Road 

Philadelphia, PA 19150 

info@pardnerlawdefense.com 
Counsel for Plaintiff 

 

Bonnie M. Daminger, Paralegal 

Dated: 7/12/2022 

 

NOTICE 

 

  IF YOU, Glenn L. Bland, wish to defend, you 
must enter a written appearance personally or by 

attorney and file your defenses or objections in 

writing with the court. You are warned that if 

you fail to do so the case may proceed without 

you and a judgment may be entered against you 

without further notice for the relief requested by 

the plaintiff. You may lose money or property or 

other rights important to you. 
  YOU SHOULD TAKE THIS PAPER TO 

YOUR LAWYER AT ONCE. IF YOU DO 

NOT HAVE A LAWYER, GO TO OR 

TELEPHONE THE OFFICE SET FORTH 

BELOW. THIS OFFICE CAN PROVIDE YOU 

WITH INFORMATION ABOUT HIRING A 

LAWYER. 
  IF YOU CANNOT AFFORD TO HIRE A 

LAWYER, THIS OFFICE MAY BE ABLE TO 

PROVIDE YOU WITH INFORMATION 

ABOUT AGENCIES THAT MAY OFFER 

LEGAL SERVICES TO ELIGIBLE PERSONS 

AT A REDUCED FEE OR NO FEE. 

 

DAUPHIN COUNTY BAR ASSOCIATION 
LAWYER REFERRAL SERVICE 

213 N. Front St. 

Harrisburg, PA 17101 

(717) 232-7536 

s2 

     

 

NAME CHANGE 

NOTICES 

 
 

IN THE COURT OF COMMON PLEAS 

OF DAUPHIN COUNTY 

PENNSYLVANIA 

 

DOCKET NO: 2022-CV-5651-NC  

 

PETITION FOR CHANGE OF NAME 

 

NOTICE 

 

  NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that on July 22, 

2022 the Petition of Tairyn Maliik Shelley was 

filed in the above named court, requesting a 

decree to change his name from Tairyn Maliik 

Shelley to Maliik Shelley. 

mailto:info@pardnerlawdefense.com


 

  The Court has fixed Monday, September 26, 

2022 at 10:00 a.m. in Courtroom No. 9,  2nd 

Floor, Dauphin County Courthouse, 101 Market 
Street, Harrisburg, PA 17101 as the time and 

place for the hearing on said Petition, when and 

where all persons interested may appear and 

show cause if any they have, why the prayer of 

the said Petition should not be granted.                s2 

     

 

IN THE COURT OF COMMON PLEAS 

OF DAUPHIN COUNTY 

PENNSYLVANIA 

 

DOCKET NO: 2022-CV-03151-NC  

 

PETITION FOR CHANGE OF NAME  

 

NOTICE 
 

  NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that on April 

20, 2022 the Petition of Kevin Dawayne Smith 

was filed in the above named court, requesting a 

decree to change his name from Kevin 

Dawayne Smith to Moses Ben Israel.  

  The Court has fixed Monday, September 26, 
2022 at 9:00 a.m. in Courtroom No. 9, 2nd Floor, 

Dauphin County Courthouse, 101 Market Street, 

Harrisburg, PA 17101 as the time and place for 

the hearing on said Petition, when and where all 

persons interested may appear and show cause if 

any they have, why the prayer of the said 

Petition should not be granted.                 s2 
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The Board of Directors of the Bar Association meets on the third Thursday of the month at the Bar 

Association headquarters. Anyone wishing to attend or have matters brought before the Board should contact 

the Bar Association office in advance. 

 
  

 

REPORTING OF ERRORS IN ADVANCE SHEET 

 

  The Bench and Bar will contribute to the accuracy in matters of detail of the permanent edition of the 

Dauphin County Reporter by sending to the editor promptly, notice of all errors appearing in this advance 

sheet. Inasmuch as corrections are made on a continuous basis, there can be no assurance that corrections can 

be made later than thirty (30) days from the date of this issue but this should not discourage the submission 
of notice of errors after thirty (30) days since they will be handled in some way if at all possible. Please send 

such notice of errors to: Dauphin County Reporter, Dauphin County Bar Association, 213 North Front Street, 

Harrisburg, PA 17101-1493. 

 

DAUPHIN COUNTY COURT SECTION 

Opinions Not Yet Reported 

 
  

http://www.dcba-pa.org/
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ATTORNEY: Nikolaus & Hohenadel, LLP, a full service law firm, is seeking a full time attorney with 0-3 

years’ experience. The candidate should have a strong work ethic along with excellent communication and 

writing skills. Compensation is commensurate with experience. All applicants will be held in strict 
confidence. Interested and qualified applicants should submit their resume and letter of interest via email to 

msmith@n-hlaw.com or by mail to Michele Smith, Nikolaus & Hohenadel, LLP, 212 North Queen Street, 

Lancaster, PA 17603.                                                                                                                                 a19-s2 

 

ASSOCIATE ATTORNEY: The law offices of Marshall Dennehey Warner Coleman & Goggin, a leading 

civil defense litigation firm, is seeking an Associate Attorney for its Harrisburg, PA office with 3- 6 years of 

litigation experience to defend Employment Law, School Leaders’ Liability and Legal Malpractice cases. 

As a regional office of Marshall Dennehey Warner Coleman & Goggin, the Harrisburg, PA office is backed 
by the resources of a 500+ lawyer firm. It stands ready to assist every client - be they individuals, small 

businesses, large corporations or insurance carriers - by providing high-quality, results-oriented legal 

representation that is both innovative and cost-effective.  Marshall Dennehey is not accepting unsolicited 

resumes from search firms for this position.  Firm offers a sound future, competitive salary and an excellent 

benefits package. Qualified candidates should submit cover letter and resume to 

HRRecruiter@MDWCG.com for consideration.  We are an Equal Opportunity Employer AA/M/F/D/V. 

a19-s2 
 

ASSOCIATE ATTORNEY: The law offices of Marshall Dennehey Warner Coleman & Goggin, a leading 

civil defense litigation firm, is seeking an Associate Attorney for its Harrisburg, PA office with 0 - 2 years 

of experience to handle Insurance Coverage/Bad Faith matters as well as assisting in the defense of 

miscellaneous Professional Liability matters. As a regional office of Marshall Dennehey Warner Coleman & 

Goggin, the Harrisburg, PA office is backed by the resources of a 500+ lawyer firm. It stands ready to assist 

every client—be they individuals, small businesses, large corporations or insurance carriers - by providing 

high-quality, results-oriented legal representation that is both innovative and cost-effective.  Marshall 
Dennehey is not accepting unsolicited resumes from search firms for this position.  Firm offers a sound future, 

competitive salary and an excellent benefits package.  Qualified candidates should submit cover letter and 

resume to HRRecruiter@MDWCG.com for consideration.  We are an Equal Opportunity Employer 
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