
 

ESTATE & TRUST 
NOTICES 

 
FIRST PUBLICATION 

 
  ESTATE OF CHRISTIE FRANCES 
MORRIS, a/k/a CHRISTIE F. MORRIS, late 
of Lower Swatara Township, Dauphin County, 
PA 
  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 
the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 
given to request all persons having claims 
against the decedent to make known the same to 
the Executrix or attorney, and all persons 
indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 
Executrix without delay. 
  Executrix: Colleen Steckbeck 
  Attorney: Charles A. Ritchie, Jr., Esquire, 
Feather and Feather, P.C., 22 West Main Street, 
Annville, PA 17003                                    a9-23 
     
 
  ESTATE OF ROBERT SAMUEL PANZA, 
a/k/a ROBERT S. PANZA late of Harrisburg 
City, Dauphin County, PA 
  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 
the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 
given to request all persons having claims 
against the decedent to make known the same to 
the Executrix or attorney, and all persons 
indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 
Executrix without delay. 
  Executrix: Barbara P. Smith, c/o Stock and 
Leader, 221 West Philadelphia Street, Suite 600 
York, PA 17401 
  Attorney: Jody Anderson Leighty, STOCK 
AND LEADER                                           a9-23 
     
 
  ESTATE OF PAUL C. DEMKO, JR., late of 
Middletown Borough, Dauphin County, PA 
  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 
the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 
given to request all persons having claims 
against the decedent to make known the same to 
the Administrator or attorney, and all persons 
indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 
Administrator without delay. 
  Administrator: Richard Paul Demko, c/o Lisa 
Marie Coyne, Esquire, COYNE & COYNE, 
P.C., 3901 Market Street, Camp Hill, PA 17011-
4227                                                             a9-23 
     
 
  ESTATE OF CHRISTOPHER E. 
BRICKER, late of the Township of Conewago, 
County of Dauphin and Commonwealth of PA. 
  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 
the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 
given to request all persons having claims 

against the decedent to make known the same to 
the Executor or attorney, and all persons 
indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 
Executor without delay. 
  Executor: Curtis E. Bricker, c/o Nikolaus & 
Hohenadel, LLP, 222 S. Market Street, Suite 
201, Elizabethtown, PA 17022 
  Attorney: Kevin D. Dolan, Esq.               a9-23 
     
 
  ESTATE OF HANNAH J. MAURER, late of 
the Borough of Millersburg, Dauphin County, 
PA (died: December 30, 2020) 
  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 
the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 
given to request all persons having claims 
against the decedent to make known the same to 
the Administratrix or attorney, and all persons 
indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 
Administratrix without delay. 
  Administratrix: Gail B. Miller, 320 Oakdale 
Drive, P.O. Box 343, Gratz, Pennsylvania 17030 
  Attorney: Joseph D. Kerwin, Esq., Kerwin & 
Kerwin, LLP, 4245 State Route 209, 
Elizabethville, Pennsylvania 17023            a9-23 
     
 
  ESTATE OF LESTER E. SNYDER, JR., 
late of the Borough of Lykens, Dauphin County, 
PA (died: February 21, 2021) 
  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 
the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 
given to request all persons having claims 
against the decedent to make known the same to 
the Co-Executrices or attorney, and all persons 
indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 
Co-Executrices without delay. 
  Co-Executrices: Michele A. Owen, 1211 W. 
Southern Avenue, Box 641, Williamsport, 
Pennsylvania 17702; Kelly A. Laudenslager, 
128 Blue Ridge Circle, Harrisburg, 
Pennsylvania 17110 
  Attorney: Gregory M. Kerwin, Kerwin & 
Kerwin, LLP, 4245 State Route 209, 
Elizabethville, Pennsylvania 17023            a9-23 
     
 
  ESTATE OF MELVIN R. LEBO, JR., late 
of the Township of Halifax, Dauphin County, 
PA (died: February 26, 2021) 
  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 
the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 
given to request all persons having claims 
against the decedent to make known the same to 
the Co-Executors or attorney, and all persons 
indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 
Co-Executors without delay. 
  Co-Executors: Chad M. Lebo, 550 Middle 
Road, Halifax, Pennsylvania 17032; Greggory 
T. Webster, 5350 Wilshire Road, Harrisburg, 
Pennsylvania 17112 
  Attorney: Terrence J. Kerwin, Esq., Kerwin & 



 

Kerwin, LLP, 4245 State Route 209, 
Elizabethville, Pennsylvania 17023            a9-23 
     
 
  ESTATE OF DEBORAH A. LEBO, late of 
the Township of Halifax, Dauphin County, PA 
(died: March 11, 2021) 
  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 
the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 
given to request all persons having claims 
against the decedent to make known the same to 
the Co-Executors or attorney, and all persons 
indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 
Co-Executors without delay. 
  Co-Executors: Chad M. Lebo, 550 Middle 
Road, Halifax, Pennsylvania 17032; Greggory 
T. Webster, 5350 Wilshire Road, Harrisburg, 
Pennsylvania 17112 
  Attorney: Terrence J. Kerwin, Esq., Kerwin & 
Kerwin, LLP, 4245 State Route 209, 
Elizabethville, Pennsylvania 17023            a9-23 
     
 
  ESTATE OF VICKI M. WALSH, late of 
Lower Paxton Township, Dauphin County, PA 
  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 
the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 
given to request all persons having claims 
against the decedent to make known the same to 
the Executrix or attorney, and all persons 
indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 
Executrix without delay. 
  Executrix: Kelly A. Penny, c/o Craig A. 
Hatch, Esq., CELA, Halbruner, Hatch & Guise, 
LLP, 2109 Market Street, Camp Hill, PA 17011 

a9-23 
     
 
  ESTATE OF JOAN E. WILBERT, a/k/a 
JOAN ELIZABETH WILBERT, late of 
Lower Paxton Township, Dauphin County, PA 
  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 
the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 
given to request all persons having claims 
against the decedent to make known the same to 
the Executor or attorney, and all persons 
indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 
Executor without delay. 
  Executor: Shannon K. Wilbert, c/o Craig A 
Hatch, Esq., CELA, Halbruner, Hatch & Guise, 
LLP, 2109 Market Street, Camp Hill, PA 17011 

a9-23 
     
 
  ESTATE OF MICHAEL S. POINDEXTER, 
late of West Hanover Township, Dauphin 
County, PA (died: January 25, 2021) 
  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 
the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 
given to request all persons having claims 
against the decedent to make known the same to 
the Administratrix or attorney, and all persons 

indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 
Administratrix without delay. 
  Administratrix: Kristin A. Rhoads, 1272 
Azalea Trail, Harrisburg, PA 17112 
  Attorney: John W. Purcell, Esquire, Purcell, 
Krug & Haller, 1719 North Front Street, 
Harrisburg, PA 17102                                 a9-23 
     
 
  ESTATE OF MELVIN H. FUREMAN, SR., 
a/k/a MELVIN H. FUREMAN, MELVIN 
FUREMAN, late of East Hanover Township, 
Dauphin County, PA 
  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 
the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 
given to request all persons having claims 
against the decedent to make known the same to 
the Executor or attorney, and all persons 
indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 
Executor without delay. 
  Executor: Melvin H. Fureman, Jr., c/o James 
D. Bogar, Esq., Bogar & Hipp Law Offices, 
LLC, One West Main Street, Shiremanstown, 
PA 17011                                                    a9-23 
     
 
  ESTATE OF JUDY A. SCHRUM, late of the 
Township of Lower Paxton, County of Dauphin 
and Commonwealth of PA 
  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 
the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 
given to request all persons having claims 
against the decedent to make known the same to 
the Executor or attorney, and all persons 
indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 
Executor without delay. 
  Executor: Peter E. Schrum, 2650 Ellendale 
Road, Dauphin, PA 17018 
  Attorney: Gerald J. Shekletski, Esquire, PO 
Box E, New Cumberland, PA 17070          a9-23 
     
 
  ESTATE OF BARBARA J. DWYER, late of 
Dauphin County, PA (died: July 9, 2019) 
  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 
the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 
given to request all persons having claims 
against the decedent to make known the same to 
the Executor or attorney, and all persons 
indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 
Executor without delay. 
  Executor: Robert E. Dwyer, 29 Banbury Road, 
Hummelstown, PA 17036 
  Attorney: Brandon S. O'Connor, Esquire, 
METTE, EVANS & WOODSIDE, 3401 North 
Front Street, P.O. Box 5950, Harrisburg, PA 
17110-0950                                                 a9-23 
     
 
 
 
 



 

SECOND PUBLICATION 
 
  ESTATE OF GREGORY R. BUSH, late of 
Dauphin, Dauphin County, PA (died: 
01/28/2021) 
  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 
the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 
given to request all persons having claims 
against the decedent to make known the same to 
the Administratrix or attorney, and all persons 
indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 
Administratrix without delay. 
  Administratrix: Virginia A. Bush, c/o George 
W. Porter, Esquire, 909 East Chocolate Avenue, 
Hershey, Pennsylvania 17033                     a2-16 
     
 
  ESTATE OF LOIS D. DEAN, late of Middle 
Paxton Township, Dauphin County, PA (died: 
December 30, 2020) 
  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 
the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 
given to request all persons having claims 
against the decedent to make known the same to 
the Administrators or attorney, and all persons 
indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 
Administrators without delay. 
  Administrators: William B. Dean, II, 1231 
Buttonwood Drive, Dauphin, PA 17018; 
Cynthia M. Zubritsky, 810 General Howe Drive, 
West Chester, PA 19382 
  Attorney: Robert G. Radebach, Esquire, 912 
North River Road, Halifax, PA 17032; (717) 
896-2666                                                     a2-16 
     
 
  ESTATE OF MABEL J. HINKLEY, late of 
South Hanover Township, Dauphin County, PA 
  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 
the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 
given to request all persons having claims 
against the decedent to make known the same to 
the Co-Executors or attorney, and all persons 
indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 
Co-Executors without delay. 
  Co-Executors: Daniel S. Hinkley and James 
C. Hinkley 
  Attorney: Estate of MABEL J. HINKLEY, 
Reilly Wolfson Law Office, 1601 Cornwall 
Road, Lebanon, PA 17042                          a2-16 
     
 
  ESTATE OF JOSEPHINE C. BARNES, late 
of Lower Paxton Township, Dauphin County, 
PA (died: January 21, 2021) 
  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 
the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 
given to request all persons having claims 
against the decedent to make known the same to 
the Co-Executors or attorney, and all persons 
indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 
Co-Executors without delay. 

  Co-Executors: Richard Caloiero and Cheryl 
Caloiero 
  Attorney: Vicky Ann Trimmer, Esquire, 
Daley Zucker Meilton & Miner, LLC, 635 N. 
12th Street, Suite 101, Lemoyne, PA 17043 

a2-16 
     

 
  ESTATE OF WINIFRED A. SCHUCKER, 
late of Elizabethville Borough, Dauphin County, 
PA 
  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 
the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 
given to request all persons having claims 
against the decedent to make known the same to 
the Executrix or attorney, and all persons 
indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 
Executrix without delay. 
 Executrix: Karen S. Welker, P.O. Box 685, 
Elizabethville, PA 17023 
  Attorney: Andrew S. Withers, Esquire, 
Etzweiler and Withers, 105 N. Front Street, 
Harrisburg, PA 17101; (717) 234-5600      a2-16 
     
 
  ESTATE OF SHIRLEY A. SHEETZ, late of 
Lower Paxton Township, Dauphin County, PA 
  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 
the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 
given to request all persons having claims 
against the decedent to make known the same to 
the Executor or attorney, and all persons 
indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 
Executor without delay. 
  Executor: Ronald L. Snow, Jr. 
  Attorney: Katie J. Maxwell, Esquire, 
WALTERS & GALLOWAY, PLLC, 54 East 
Main Street, Mechanicsburg, PA 17055     a2-16 
     
 
  ESTATE OF SANDRA A. GRIMM, late of 
the Township of Wiconisco, County of Dauphin, 
PA (died: January 30, 2021) 
  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 
the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 
given to request all persons having claims 
against the decedent to make known the same to 
the Executor or attorney, and all persons 
indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 
Executor without delay. 
  Executor: Gregory L. Grimm, Jr., 1011 West 
Chestnut Street, Coal Township, Pennsylvania 
17866 
  Attorney: Joseph D Kerwin, Kerwin & 
Kerwin, LLP, 4245 State Route 209, 
Elizabethville, Pennsylvania 17023            a2-16 
     
 
  ESTATE OF PATRICIA A. BIGNEY, late 
of Swatara Township, Dauphin County, PA 
  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 
the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 



 

given to request all persons having claims 
against the decedent to make known the same to 
the Executrix or attorney, and all persons 
indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 
Executrix without delay. 
  Executrix: Marilyn C. Linko, 5981 
Huntingdon Circle, Harrisburg, PA 17111 
  Attorney: Butler Law Firm, 1007 Mumma 
Road, Suite 101, Lemoyne, PA 17043        a2-16 
     
 
  ESTATE OF FANNIE HAZEL JORDAN, 
a/k/a FANNIE H. JORDAN, late of the City of 
Harrisburg, Dauphin County, PA (died: 
November 20, 2020) 
  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 
the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 
given to request all persons having claims 
against the decedent to make known the same to 
the Co-Administrators or attorney, and all 
persons indebted to the decedent to make 
payment to the Co-Administrators without 
delay. 
  Co-Administrators: Marian D. Thomas, 1966 
Daybreak Circle, Harrisburg, PA 17110; Shane 
L. Reid, 194 Lincoln Ave., Harrisburg, PA 
17111 
  Attorney: Madelaine N. Baturin, Esquire, 
BATURIN & BATURIN, 2604 North Second 
Street, Harrisburg, PA 17110                      a2-16 
     
 
  ESTATE OF CHARLES L. WYNN, late of 
the Township of Susquehanna, Dauphin County 
PA 
  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 
the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 
given to request all persons having claims 
against the decedent to make known the same to 
the Executor or attorney, and all persons 
indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 
Executor without delay. 
  Executrix: Bonnie R. Jones, 4436 Brighton 
Court, Harrisburg, PA  17112 
  Attorney: Theresa L. Shade Wix, Esq., Wix 
Wenger & Weidner, 4705 Duke Street, 
Harrisburg PA 17109-3041                         a2-16 
     
 
  ESTATE OF DENISE M. VALENTE a/k/a 
DENISE MICHELE ANDERSON-
VALENTE, late of Derry Township, Dauphin 
County, PA (died: February 5, 2021) 
  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 
the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 
given to request all persons having claims 
against the decedent to make known the same to 
the Executor or attorney, and all persons 
indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 
Executor without delay. 
  Executor: John D. Peters, 614 Olde Course 
Road, Hershey, PA 17033 

  Attorney: Edward P. Seeber, Esquire, JSDC 
Law Offices, 11 East Chocolate Avenue, Suite 
300, Hershey, PA 17033; (717) 533-3280  a2-16 
     
 
  ESTATE OF ELINOR A. BENEFIELD, 
a/k/a ELINOR ANNE BENEFIELD, late of 
Middletown Borough, Dauphin County, PA 
  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 
the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 
given to request all persons having claims 
against the decedent to make known the same to 
the Executor or attorney, and all persons 
indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 
Executor without delay. 
  Executor: Francis X. Buschman, Jr., 405 
Schoolhouse Road, Sellersville, Pennsylvania 
18960                                                           a2-16 
     
 
  ESTATE OF RICHARD J. VAJDA, late of 
Susquehanna Township, Dauphin County, PA 
  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 
the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 
given to request all persons having claims 
against the decedent to make known the same to 
the Executor or attorney, and all persons 
indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 
Executor without delay. 
  Executor: Chris Warehime, 8 Blackmore 
Court, Camp Hill, PA 17011 
  Attorney: Butler Law Firm, 1007 Mumma 
Road, Suite 101, Lemoyne, PA 17043        a2-16 
     
 
  ESTATE OF SARAH J. LAWSON, a/k/a 
SARAH JANE LAWSON, late of Dauphin 
County, PA (died: February 7, 2021) 
  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 
the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 
given to request all persons having claims 
against the decedent to make known the same to 
the Co-Executors or attorney, and all persons 
indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 
Co-Executors without delay. 
  Co-Executors: Alexander Lawson, 917 
Wenrich Street, Harrisburg, PA 17112; Kyle 
Lawson, 840 Dartmouth Street, Apt. C356, 
Harrisburg, PA 17109 
  Attorney: Steven J. Schiffman, Esq., 
SCHIFFMAN, SHERIDAN & BROWN, P.C., 
2080 Linglestown Road, Suite 201, Harrisburg, 
PA 17110                                                    a2-16 
     
 
  ESTATE OF RUBY R. WINGATE, late of 
Susquehanna Township, Dauphin County, PA 
(died: October 12, 2020) 
  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 
the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 
given to request all persons having claims 
against the decedent to make known the same to 



 

the Executor or attorney, and all persons 
indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 
Executor without delay. 
  Executor: Keith R.B. Wingate 
  Attorney: Vicky Ann Trimmer, Esquire, 
Daley Zucker, LLC, 635 N. 12th Street, Suite 
101, Lemoyne, PA 17043                           a2-16 
     
 
  ESTATE OF JAMES LLOYD KEARNS, 
late of Lower Paxton Township, PA 
  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 
the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 
given to request all persons having claims 
against the decedent to make known the same to 
the Executrix or attorney, and all persons 
indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 
Executrix without delay. 
  Executrix: Jennifer Harris c/o Young and 
Young, 44 S. Main Street, P.O. Box 126, 
Manheim PA 17545 
  Attorney: Young and Young                    a2-16 
     
 
  ESATE OF JOYCE H. WILLIAMS a/k/a 
JOYCE L. WILLIAMS, late of West Hanover, 
Township, Dauphin County, PA (died: 
02/05/2021) 
  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 
the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 
given to request all persons having claims 
against the decedent to make known the same to 
the Executor or attorney, and all persons 
indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 
Executor without delay. 
  Executor: Gary J. Imblum, Esquire, 4615 
Derry Street, Harrisburg, PA 17111 
  Attorney: Gary J. Imblum, Esquire, Imblum 
Law Offices, PC, 4615 Derry Street, Harrisburg, 
PA 17111                                                    a2-16 
     
 
  ESTATE OF FRANCIS P. GRADY a/k/a 
F.P. GRADY, late of Lower Paxton Township, 
Dauphin County, PA 
  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 
the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 
given to request all persons having claims 
against the decedent to make known the same to 
the Executor or attorney, and all persons 
indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 
Executor without delay. 
  Executor: Christopher Grady c/o 
  Attorney: Angela M. Ward, Esquire, Going & 
Plank, 140 E. King Street, Lancaster, PA  17602 

a2-16 
     

 
  ESTATE OF FELIX TORRES a/k/a F. 
TORRES MORALES, FELIX L. TORRES, 
late of Harrisburg City, Dauphin County, PA 
(died: October 15, 2020) 

  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 
the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 
given to request all persons having claims 
against the decedent to make known the same to 
the Personal Representative or attorney, and all 
persons indebted to the decedent to make 
Personal Representative to the Executor without 
delay. 
  Personal Representative: Pedro Black, c/o  
  Attorney: Patrick S. Cawley, Esq., Keystone 
Elder Law P.C., 555 Gettysburg Pike, Suite B-
200, Mechanicsburg, PA 17055                  a2-16 
     
 
  ESTATE OF JUDITH ELLEN 
YUPCAVAGE a/k/a JUDITH E. 
YUPCAVAGE, late of Derry Township, 
Dauphin County, PA (died: 09/10/2019) 
  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 
the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 
given to request all persons having claims 
against the decedent to make known the same to 
the Administrator or attorney, and all persons 
indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 
Administrator without delay. 
  Administrator: Jan B. Yupcavage, c/o George 
W. Porter, Esquire, 909 East Chocolate Avenue, 
Hershey, Pennsylvania 17033                     a2-16 
     
 
  ESTATE OF CAMILLE SCHELL a/k/a 
CAMILLE M. SCHELL a/k/a CAMILLE W. 
SCHELL a/k/a CAMILLE MARIE 
SCHELL, late of Derry Township, Dauphin 
County, PA (died: 02/26/2021) 
  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 
the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 
given to request all persons having claims 
against the decedent to make known the same to 
the Executrix or attorney, and all persons 
indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 
Executrix without delay. 
  Executrix: Raeann Schell, c/o George W. 
Porter, Esquire, 909 East Chocolate Avenue, 
Hershey, Pennsylvania 17033                     a2-16 
     

 
THIRD PUBLICATION 

 
  ESTATE OF BRADFORD E. KEPNER, 
late of Derry Township, Dauphin County, PA 
(died: 02/21/2021) 
  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 
the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 
given to request all persons having claims 
against the decedent to make known the same to 
the Executrix or attorney, and all persons 
indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 
Executrix without delay. 
  Executrix: Karen S. Kulp, c/o George W. 
Porter, Esquire, 909 East Chocolate Avenue, 



 

Hershey, Pennsylvania 17033                  m26-a9 
     
 
  ESTATE OF JAMES J. WARREN, a/k/a 
JUNIUS JAMES WARREN, late of Dauphin 
County, PA 
  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 
the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 
given to request all persons having claims 
against the decedent to make known the same to 
the Administrator or attorney, and all persons 
indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 
Administrator without delay. 
  Administrator: James E. Warren, Sr., c/o 
William R. Kaufman, Esq., 940 Century Drive, 
Mechanicsburg, PA 17055-4376             m26-a9 
     
 
  ESTATE OF LINDA J. ZUVICH, a/k/a 
LINDA JANE ZUVICH late of West Hanover 
Township, Dauphin County, PA 
  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 
the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 
given to request all persons having claims 
against the decedent to make known the same to 
the Executrix or attorney, and all persons 
indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 
Executrix without delay. 
  Executrix:  Maria L. Zuvich (Torres), c/o 
Vance E. Antonacci, Esquire, McNees Wallace 
& Nurick LLC, 570 Lausch Lane, Suite 200 
Lancaster, PA  17601 
  Attorney:  McNees Wallace & Nurick LLC 

m26-a9 
     

 
  ESTATE OF JACK L. HERB a/k/a 
JACKIE L. HERB, late of the Borough of 
Williamstown, County of Dauphin, PA (died: 
December 23, 2020) 
  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 
the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 
given to request all persons having claims 
against the decedent to make known the same to 
the Executor or attorney, and all persons 
indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 
Executor without delay. 
  Executor: Paul D. Herb, 406 Pottsville Street, 
Lykens, Pennsylvania 17048 
  Attorney: Joseph D. Kerwin, Esquire, Kerwin 
& Kerwin, LLP, 4245 State Route 209, 
Elizabethville, Pennsylvania 17023         m26-a9 
     
 
  ESTATE OF EDELGARD WARWAS, late 
of Derry Township, Dauphin County, PA (died: 
January 30, 2021) 
  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 
the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 
given to request all persons having claims 
against the decedent to make known the same to 
the Co-Administrators or attorney, and all 

persons indebted to the decedent to make 
payment to the Co-Administrators without 
delay. 
  Co-Administrators: Monique Olsen and Erald 
Warwas, 137 Somerset Drive, Hershey, PA 
17033 
  Attorney: Edward P. Seeber, Esquire, JSDC 
LAW OFFICES, 11 East Chocolate Avenue, 
Suite 300, Hershey, PA 17033; (717) 533-3280 

m26-a9 
     
 
  ESTATE OF WILLIAM E. CLEMM, late of 
Middle Paxton Township, Dauphin County, PA 
(died: September 24, 2020) 
  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 
the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 
given to request all persons having claims 
against the decedent to make known the same to 
the Executrix or attorney, and all persons 
indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 
Executrix without delay. 
  Executrix: Janee L. King, 614 Erie Street, 
Dauphin, PA 17018 
  Attorney: Robert G. Radebach, Esquire, 912 
North River Road, Halifax, PA 17032; (717) 
896-2666                                                  m26-a9 
     
 
  ESTATE OF RICHARD M. MILLER, late 
of South Hanover Township, Dauphin County, 
PA (died: December 6, 2020) 
  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 
the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 
given to request all persons having claims 
against the decedent to make known the same to 
the Personal Representative or attorney, and all 
persons indebted to the decedent to make 
payment to the Personal Representative without 
delay. 
  Personal Representative: Dawn L. 
Neiswender, 95 Paradise Rd., Duncannon PA 
17020 
  Attorney: Jean D. Seibert, Esquire 
CALDWELL & KEARNS, PC, 3631 N. Front 
St., Harrisburg, PA 17110                        m26-a9 
     
 
  ESTATE OF RICHARD P. MCNEAL, late 
of West Hanover Township, Dauphin County, 
PA (died: November 28, 2020) 
  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 
the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 
given to request all persons having claims 
against the decedent to make known the same to 
the Personal Representative or attorney, and all 
persons indebted to the decedent to make 
payment to the Personal Representative without 
delay. 
  Personal Representative: Joan M. McNeal, 
631 Walnut Ave., Harrisburg, PA 17112 
  Attorney: Jean D. Seibert, Esquire, 



 

CALDWELL & KEARNS, PC, 3631 N. Front 
St. Harrisburg, PA 17110                         m26-a9 
     
 
  ESTATE OF MARY E. HILLMAN, late of 
the Township of Susquehanna, County of 
Dauphin, PA (died: January 14, 2021) 
  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 
the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 
given to request all persons having claims 
against the decedent to make known the same to 
the Executor or attorney, and all persons 
indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 
Executor without delay. 
  Executor: Michael J. Hillman, 221 Aspen 
Street, Middletown, Pennsylvania 17057 
  Attorney: Shannon Kerwin Sprow, Esq., 
Kerwin & Kerwin, LLP, 4245 State Route, 209, 
Elizabethville, Pennsylvania 17023         m26-a9 
     
 
  ESTATE OF JULIA A. MARBURGER, 
a/k/a JULIA ANNE MARBURGER, late of 
the City of Harrisburg, County of Dauphin and 
Commonwealth of PA 
  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 
the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 
given to request all persons having claims 
against the decedent to make known the same to 
the Executor or attorney, and all persons 
indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 
Executor without delay. 
  Executor: Russell A. Marburger, 800 Sam 
Snead Circle, Etters, PA l 7319 
  Attorney: Gerald J. Shekletski, Esquire, PO 
Box E, New Cumberland, PA 17070       m26-a9 
     
 
  ESTATE OF ALLEN JAMES WILLIAMS, 
late of Harrisburg City, Harrisburg, Dauphin 
County, PA 17111 (died: 12/28/2020) 
  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 
the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 
given to request all persons having claims 
against the decedent to make known the same to 
the Co-Administrators or attorney, and all 
persons indebted to the decedent to make 
payment to the Co-Administrators without 
delay. 
  Co-Administrators: Katelyn R. Williams and 
Anna M. Williams 
  Attorney: Bruce J. Warshawsky, Esquire, 
Cunningham, Chernicoff & Warshawsky, P.C., 
2320 North Second Street, Harrisburg, PA, 
17110                                                       m26-a9 
     
 
  ESTATE OF C.J.C. CLARA J. COVAGE 
a/k/a CLARA J. COVAGE a/k/a CLARA 
JOAN COVAGE, late of Derry Township, 
Dauphin County, PA (died: 01/26/2021) 
  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 

the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 
given to request all persons having claims 
against the decedent to make known the same to 
the Executor or attorney, and all persons 
indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 
Executor without delay. 
  Executor: Charles F. Covage, c/o George W. 
Porter, Esquire, 909 East Chocolate Avenue, 
Hershey, Pennsylvania 17033                  m26-a9 
     
 
  ESTATE OF BERTHA I. COYNE, a/k/a 
BERTHA IRENE COYNE, late of Lower 
Paxton Township, Dauphin County, PA (died: 
December 6, 2020) 
  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 
the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 
given to request all persons having claims 
against the decedent to make known the same to 
the Executor or attorney, and all persons 
indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 
Executor without delay. 
  Executor: Mr. Wayne J. Coyne, 5800 Palm 
Street, Harrisburg, PA 17112 
  Attorney: Gary L. Rothschild, Esq., 2215 
Forest Hills Drive, Suite 35, Harrisburg, PA 
17112                                                       m26-a9 
     
 
  ESTATE OF HARVEY DANOWITZ, late 
of Lower Paxton Township, Dauphin County, 
PA (died: December 17, 2020) 
  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 
the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 
given to request all persons having claims 
against the decedent to make known the same to 
the Executor or attorney, and all persons 
indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 
Executor without delay. 
  Executor: Mr. Michael Danowitz, 3909 
Rockwood Farm Road, Newtown Square, PA 
19073 
  Attorney: Gary L. Rothschild, Esq., 2215 
Forest Hills Drive, Suite 35, Harrisburg, PA 
17112                                                       m26-a9 
     
 
  ESTATE OF GLENN A. MARTIN, a/k/a 
GLENN AMBROSE MARTIN, late of Lower 
Paxton Township, Dauphin County, PA (died: 
January 29, 2021).  
  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 
the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 
given to request all persons having claims 
against the decedent to make known the same to 
the Administrator or attorney, and all persons 
indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 
Administrator without delay. 
  Administrator: Mr. Glenn David Martin, 
6513 Sanibel Drive, Harrisburg, PA 17111 
  Attorney: Gary L. Rothschild, Esq., 2215 
Forest Hills Drive, Suite 35, Harrisburg, PA 



 

17112                                                       m26-a9 
     
 
  ESTATE OF FLOYD KNAPP a/k/a 
FLOYD EUGENE KNAPP, late of Middle 
Paxton Township, Dauphin County, PA (died: 
January 26, 2021) 
  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 
the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 
given to request all persons having claims 
against the decedent to make known the same to 
the Co-Executors or attorney, and all persons 
indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 
Co-Executors without delay. 
  Co-Executors: Michael Knapp, 210 
McKelvey Road, Dauphin PA 17013; Sherrie 
Klase, 1551 Dells Lane, Dauphin PA 17018 
  Attorney: Brian J. Hinkle, Mette, Evans & 
Woodside, 3401 N. Front Street, Harrisburg PA 
17110; Telephone: (717) 232-5000         m26-a9 
     
 
  ESTATE OF GEORGE P. BLUHM, JR, late 
of HIGHSPIRE BOROUGH, Dauphin County, 
PA (died: January 8, 2021) 
  NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that Letters 
Testamentary have been granted to the 
undersigned in the above estate. All persons 
indebted to said Estate are requested to make 
immediate settlement and those having claims 
against said Estate should present them duly 
authenticated for settlement without delay. 
  Executrix: Carol Chamberlin, 102 North Main 
Street, Mansfield, PA 16933 
  Attorney: LAW OFFICE OF ROBERT W. 
CHAPPELL, 926 Main Street, P.O. Box 156, 
Rome, Pennsylvania 18837; (570) 247-2382 

m26-a9 
     
 
  TRUST ESTATE OF ADELLA M. 
WAGNER, late of Hummelstown, Dauphin 
County, PA (died: December 29, 2020) 
  All persons having claims against said Trust 
Estate are requested to make such claims known 
to the undersigned. Those persons indebted to 
the decedent are requested to make payment 
without delay to: 
  Trustees: Franklin G. Wagner, Jr., 12 
Palomino Parkway, Dillsburg, PA 17019; Erna 
K. O'Brien, 918 Sycamore Lane, Hummelstown, 
PA 17036; Rethea L. Deveney, 3 Cedar Court 
East, Carlisle, PA 17015 
  Attorney: Susan E. Lederer, Esquire, 5011 
Locust Lane, Harrisburg, PA 17109        m26-a9 
     

 
 
 
 

FIRST PUBLICATION 
 

CORPORATE NOTICES 
 
  NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that 3D 
Exhibits, Inc, a foreign corporation formed 
under the laws of the state of Illinois where its 
principal office is located at 800 Albion Ave., 
Schaumburg, IL 60193, has registered to do 
business in Pennsylvania with the Department of 
State of the Commonwealth of Pennsylvania, at 
Harrisburg, PA, on 12/22/20, under the 
provisions of the Pennsylvania Business 
Corporation Law of 1988. 
  The registered office in Pennsylvania shall be 
deemed for venue and official publication 
purposes to be located in Dauphin County.        a9 
     
 
  NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that, pursuant 
to the Business Corporation Law of 1988, 
HSBC Realty Credit Corporation, a business 
corporation incorporated under the laws of the 
Delaware, will withdraw from doing business in 
Pennsylvania. The address of its principal office 
is 95 Washington Street Buffalo, NY 14203 and 
the name of its commercial registered office 
provider in Pennsylvania is C T Corporation 
System. The statement of Withdrawal of 
Foreign Registration shall take effect upon filing 
in the Department of State.                                         a9 
     
 
  NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that Indeed 
Flex, Inc., a foreign corporation formed under 
the laws of the state of Delaware, and its 
principal office is located at 6433 Champion 
Grandview Way, Austin, TX 78750, has 
registered to do business in Pennsylvania with 
the Department of State of the Commonwealth 
of Pennsylvania, at Harrisburg, PA, on 3/3/21, 
under the provisions of the Pennsylvania 
Business Corporation Law of 1988. 
  The registered office in Pennsylvania shall be 
deemed for venue and official publication 
purposes to be located in Dauphin County.        a9 
     
 
  NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that pursuant to 
the applicable provisions of 15 Pa.C.S. Section 
415 or 417, VIAS USA, INC., a corporation 
incorporated under the laws of the State of 
Delaware with its registered office in PA at c/o: 
Corporation Service Co., Dauphin County, 
intends to file a Statement of Withdrawal of 
Foreign Registration with the Dept. of State.    a9 
     
 
 
 



 

  NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN Antios 
Therapeutics Inc, a foreign business 
corporation incorporated under the laws of 
Delaware, with its princ. office located at 20 
Horseshoe Bend Rd., Mendham, NJ 07945, has 
applied for a Statement of Registration to do 
business in Pennsylvania under the provisions of 
Chapter 4 of the Association Transactions Act. 
The commercial registered office provider in PA 
is c/o: Corporation Service Co., and shall be 
deemed for venue and official publication 
purposes to be located in Dauphin County.        a9 
     
 
  NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN VICTORY 
CAPITAL SERVICES, INC., a foreign 
business corporation incorporated under the 
laws of Delaware, with its princ. office located 
at 4900 Tiedeman Rd., 4th Fl., Brooklyn, OH 
44144, has applied for a Statement of 
Registration to do business in Pennsylvania 
under the provisions of Chapter 4 of the 
Association Transactions Act. The commercial 
registered office provider in PA is c/o: 
Corporation Service Co., and shall be deemed 
for venue and official publication purposes to be 
located in Dauphin County.                                       a9 
     
 
  NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN VICTORY 
CAPITAL TRANSFER AGENCY, INC., a 
foreign business corporation incorporated under 
the laws of Delaware, with its princ. office 
located at 4900 Tiedeman Rd., 4th Fl., Brooklyn, 
OH 44144, has applied for a Statement of 
Registration to do business in Pennsylvania 
under the provisions of Chapter 4 of the 
Association Transactions Act. The commercial 
registered office provider in PA is c/o: 
Corporation Service Co., and shall be deemed 
for venue and official publication purposes to be 
located in Dauphin County.                                       a9 
     
 
  NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN Spiralock 
Corporation, a foreign business corporation 
incorporated under the laws of Michigan, with 
its princ. office located at 49201 Gratiot Ave., 
Chesterfield, MI 48051, has applied for a 
Statement of Registration to do business in 
Pennsylvania under the provisions of Chapter 4 
of the Association Transactions Act. The 
commercial registered office provider in PA is 
c/o: Corporation Service Co., and shall be 
deemed for venue and official publication 
purposes to be located in Dauphin County.        a9 
     
 
  NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that pursuant to 
the applicable provisions of 15 Pa.C.S. Section 
415 or 417, USAA Financial Advisors, Inc., a 
corporation incorporated under the laws of the 

State of Delaware with its registered office in 
PA at c/o: Corporation Service Co., Dauphin 
County, intends to file a Statement of 
Withdrawal of Foreign Registration with the 
Dept. of State.                                                                   a9 
     
 
  NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN OnStar 
Insurance Services, Inc., a foreign business 
corporation incorporated under the laws of 
Arizona, with its princ. office located at 8825 N. 
23rd Ave., Ste. 100, Phoenix, AZ 85021, has 
applied for a Statement of Registration to do 
business in Pennsylvania under the provisions of 
Chapter 4 of the Association Transactions Act. 
The commercial registered office provider in PA 
is c/o: Corporation Service Co., and shall be 
deemed for venue and official publication 
purposes to be located in Dauphin County.        a9 
     
  
  NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN Stimwave 
Technologies Incorporated, a foreign business 
corporation incorporated under the laws of 
Delaware, with its princ. office located at 1310 
Park Central Boulevard South, Pompano Beach, 
FL 33064, has applied for a Statement of 
Registration to do business in Pennsylvania 
under the provisions of Chapter 4 of the 
Association Transactions Act. The commercial 
registered office provider in PA is c/o: 
Corporation Service Co., and shall be deemed 
for venue and official publication purposes to be 
located in Dauphin County.                                       a9 
     
 
  NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that pursuant to 
the applicable provisions of 15 Pa.C.S. Section 
415 or 417, Utility Sales and Service, Inc., a 
corporation incorporated under the laws of the 
State of Illinois with its registered office in PA 
at c/o: Corporation Service Co., Dauphin 
County, intends to file a Statement of 
Withdrawal of Foreign Registration with the 
Dept. of State.                                                                   a9 
     
 
  NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that 
RehabTECH Supply Corporation, a foreign 
corporation formed under the laws of the state of 
Illinois, and its principal office is located at 655 
W. Grand Ave., Ste. 100, Elmhurst, IL 60126, 
has registered to do business in Pennsylvania 
with the Department of State of the 
Commonwealth of Pennsylvania, at Harrisburg, 
PA, on 3/10/21, under the provisions of the 
Pennsylvania Business Corporation Law of 
1988. 
  The registered office in Pennsylvania shall be 
deemed for venue and official publication 
purposes to be located in Dauphin County.        a9 
     



 

  NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that L3 
Cincinnati Electronics Corporation, a foreign 
corporation formed under the laws of the State 
of Ohio, and its principal office is located at 
7500 Innovation Way, Mason, OH 45040, has 
registered to do business in Pennsylvania with 
the Department of State of the Commonwealth 
of Pennsylvania, at Harrisburg, PA, on 3/11/21, 
under the provisions of the Pennsylvania 
Business Corporation Law of 1988. 
  The registered office in Pennsylvania shall be 
deemed for venue and official publication 
purposes to be located in Dauphin County.        a9 
     
 
  NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that Conventus 
Orthopaedics, Inc., a foreign corporation 
formed under the laws of the state of Delaware, 
and its principal office is located at 100 Witmer 
Rd., Ste. 280, Horsham, PA 19044, has 
registered to do business in Pennsylvania with 
the Department of State of the Commonwealth 
of Pennsylvania, at Harrisburg, PA, on 3/8/21, 
under the provisions of the Pennsylvania 
Business Corporation Law of 1988. 
  The registered office in Pennsylvania shall be 
deemed for venue and official publication 
purposes to be located in Dauphin County.        a9 
     
 
  NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that 
UnitedHealthcare of Wisconsin, Inc., a 
foreign corporation formed under the laws of the 
state of Wisconsin, and its principal office is 
located at 10701 West Research Drive, 
Wauwatosa, WI 53226, has registered to do 
business in Pennsylvania with the Department of 
State of the Commonwealth of Pennsylvania, at 
Harrisburg, PA, on 3/30/21, under the 
provisions of the Pennsylvania Business 
Corporation Law of 1988. 
  The registered office in Pennsylvania shall be 
deemed for venue and official publication 
purposes to be located in Dauphin County.        a9 
     
 
  NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN all persons are 
notified that Peak Blue, Inc., a Pennsylvania 
corporation (the “Corporation”), is winding up 
its affairs in the manner prescribed by §1975 of 
the Business Corporation Law of 1988, as 
amended, so that its corporate existence shall 
cease upon the filing of Articles of Dissolution 
in the Department of State of the 
Commonwealth of Pennsylvania. All persons 
having a claim against the Corporation are 
required to present their claims against the 
Corporation in accordance with this notice. All 
such claims must be presented in writing and 
contain sufficient information reasonably to 
inform the Corporation of the identity of the 
claimant and the substance of the claim. All such 

claims must be sent to Mindi M. Albert, Esq., 
Williams Coulson, One Gateway Center, 16th 
Fl., 420 Ft. Duquesne Blvd., Pittsburgh, PA 
15222.                                                                                  a9 
     
 
  NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN all persons are 
notified that Peak Technical Services Three, 
Inc., a Pennsylvania corporation (the 
“Corporation”), is winding up its affairs in the 
manner prescribed by §1975 of the Business 
Corporation Law of 1988, as amended, so that 
its corporate existence shall cease upon the filing 
of Articles of Dissolution in the Department of 
State of the Commonwealth of Pennsylvania. 
All persons having a claim against the 
Corporation are required to present their claims 
against the Corporation in accordance with this 
notice. All such claims must be presented in 
writing and contain sufficient information 
reasonably to inform the Corporation of the 
identity of the claimant and the substance of the 
claim. All such claims must be sent to Mindi M. 
Albert, Esq., Williams Coulson, One Gateway 
Center, 16th Fl., 420 Ft. Duquesne Blvd., 
Pittsburgh, PA 15222.                                                  a9 
     
 
  NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that 
ACCELARIO SOFTWARE INC, a foreign 
business corporation, has applied for a 
Statement of Registration to do business in the 
Commonwealth of Pennsylvania under the 
provisions of Chapter 4 of the Pennsylvania 
Association Transactions Act (15 Pa. C.S. § 
6124). The corporation is incorporated under the 
laws of the State of Delaware. The address of its 
office under the laws of said jurisdiction is 3500 
South Dupont Highway, Dover, DE 19901, and 
the name of its commercial registered office 
provider in Pennsylvania is Penncorp 
Servicegroup, Inc.                                                          a9 
     
 
  NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that a Foreign 
Registration Statement has been filed with the 
Department of State of the Commonwealth of 
Pennsylvania, at Harrisburg, PA on or about 
March 24, 2021, for a foreign corporation with a 
registered address in the Commonwealth of 
Pennsylvania as follows: Kamion SCM, Inc. 
c/o United Corporate Services, Inc. 
  This corporation is incorporated under the laws 
of Delaware. 
  The address of its principal office is 2525 
Hains Road, Mississauga, Ontario, Canada L4Y 
1Y7. 
  The corporation has been qualified in 
Pennsylvania under the provisions of the 
Business Corporation Law of 1988, as amended. 

a9 
     



 

  NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN ALSID INC, a 
foreign business corporation incorporated under 
the laws of Delaware, with its princ. office 
located at 990 Biscayne Blvd., Office 701, 
Miami, FL 33132, has applied for a Statement of 
Registration to do business in Pennsylvania 
under the provisions of Chapter 4 of the 
Association Transactions Act. The street address 
in the association's jurisdiction of formation is 
251 Little Falls Dr., Wilmington, DE 19808. The 
commercial registered office provider in PA is 
c/o: Corporation Service Co., and shall be 
deemed for venue and official publication 
purposes to be located in Dauphin County.        a9 
     
 
  NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN CX360, Inc., a 
foreign business corporation incorporated under 
the laws of Delaware, with its princ. office 
located at 11808 Miracle Hills Dr., Omaha, NE 
68154, has applied for a Statement of 
Registration to do business in Pennsylvania 
under the provisions of Chapter 4 of the 
Association Transactions Act. The street address 
in the association's jurisdiction of formation is 
251 Little Falls Dr., Wilmington, DE 19808. The 
commercial registered office provider in PA is 
c/o: Corporation Service Co., and shall be 
deemed for venue and official publication 
purposes to be located in Dauphin County.        a9 
     
  
  NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that pursuant to 
the applicable provisions of 15 Pa.C.S. Section 
415 or 417, JABMO, INC., a corporation 
incorporated under the laws of the State of 
Delaware with its registered office in PA at c/o: 
CT Corporation System, Dauphin County, 
intends to file a Statement of Withdrawal of 
Foreign Registration with the Dept. of State.    a9 
     
 
  NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that 
Objectstream, Inc., a foreign corporation 
formed under the laws of the State of Oklahoma, 
and its principal office is located at 7725 W. 
Reno Ave., Ste. 307, Oklahoma City, OK 73127, 
has registered to do business in Pennsylvania 
with the Department of State of the 
Commonwealth of Pennsylvania, at Harrisburg, 
PA, on 3/30/21, under the provisions of the 
Pennsylvania Business Corporation Law of 
1988. 
  The registered office in Pennsylvania shall be 
deemed for venue and official publication 
purposes to be located in Dauphin County.        a9 
     
 
  NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that Codex 
Technologies, Inc., a foreign corporation 
formed under the laws of the state of Delaware, 
and its principal office is located at 5182 Liberty 

Ave., #9151, Pittsburgh, PA 15224, has 
registered to do business in Pennsylvania with 
the Department of State of the Commonwealth 
of Pennsylvania, at Harrisburg, PA, on 3/30/21, 
under the provisions of the Pennsylvania 
Business Corporation Law of 1988. 
  The registered office in Pennsylvania shall be 
deemed for venue and official publication 
purposes to be located in Dauphin County.        a9 
     
 
  NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that pursuant to 
the applicable provisions of 15 Pa.C.S. Section 
415 or 417, INNOCHEM INC., a corporation 
incorporated under the laws of the State of 
Delaware with its registered office in PA at c/o: 
Corporation Service Co., Dauphin County, 
intends to file a Statement of Withdrawal of 
Foreign Registration with the Dept. of State.    a9 
     
 
  NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that pursuant to 
the applicable provisions of 15 Pa.C.S. Section 
415 or 417, Tencon, Inc., a corporation 
incorporated under the laws of the State of 
Tennessee with its registered office in PA at c/o: 
Corporation Service Co., Dauphin County, 
intends to file a Statement of Withdrawal of 
Foreign Registration with the Dept. of State.    a9 
     
 
  NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that Articles of 
Incorporation have been filed with the 
Department of the Commonwealth of 
Pennsylvania on or before 3/29/2021, with 
respect to a proposed nonprofit corporation, 
Dublin Crossing Community Association, 
Inc., which has been incorporated under the 
Nonprofit Corporation Law of 1988. The 
address of the registered office is c/o: Dublin 
Tower Center, LP, 1128 Slotter Rd., Perkasie, 
PA 18944. A brief summary of the purpose or 
purposes for which said corporation is organized 
is: Exclusively to operate as the planned 
community association of Dublin Crossing, and 
for any other reason as permitted under the PA 
Uniform Planned Community Act, 68 PA. C.S. 
5101 et seq.                                                                        a9 
     
 
  NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that Actility 
U.S. Corp., a foreign business corporation 
incorporated under the laws of the State of 
Delaware, received a Certificate of 
Authority/Foreign Registration in Pennsylvania 
on May 4, 2018, and will surrender its 
Certificate of Authority/Foreign Registration to 
do business in Pennsylvania. 
  The address of its principal office is 121 West 
36th Street, #237, New York, NY 10018. 
  Its last registered office in this Commonwealth 
was located at: c/o Corp 2000, Inc. and the last 



 

registered office shall be deemed for venue and 
official publication purposes to be located in 
Dauphin County, Pennsylvania.                              a9 
     
 
  NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that Articles of 
Incorporation were filed with the Department of 
State of the Commonwealth of Pennsylvania at 
Harrisburg on October 8, 2020, for the purpose 
of obtaining a Certificate of Incorporation for a 
non-profit corporation organized under the 
Nonprofit Corporation Law of 1988, Act of 
December 21, 1988, P.L. 1444, No. 177, as 
amended.   
  The name of the corporation is:   Preserve 
Fishing Creek Valley, Inc. 
  This notice is given pursuant to Section 1307 
of the Business Corporation Law of 1988.   
 

Mark D. Hipp 
METTE, EVANS & WOODSIDE 
3401 North Front Street, 2nd Floor 

P.O. Box 5950 
a9                           Harrisburg, PA  17110-0950 
     
 
  NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that Articles of 
Incorporation were filed with the Department of 
State of the Commonwealth of Pennsylvania at 
Harrisburg on October 8, 2020, for the purpose 
of obtaining a Certificate of Incorporation for a 
non-profit corporation organized under the 
Nonprofit Corporation Law of 1988, Act of 
December 21, 1988, P.L. 1444, No. 177, as 
amended.   
  The name of the corporation is:  We the People 
Leadership Academies, Inc. 
  This notice is given pursuant to Section 1307 
of the Business Corporation Law of 1988.   
 

Mark D. Hipp 
METTE, EVANS & WOODSIDE 
3401 North Front Street, 2nd Floor 

P.O. Box 5950 
a9                           Harrisburg, PA  17110-0950   
     

 
  NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN Falcon Group 
Americas Corporation, a foreign business 
corporation incorporated under the laws of 
Delaware, with its princ. office located at PMB 
#19, 2801 Centerville Rd., First Floor, 
Wilmington, DE 19808-1609, has applied for a 
Statement of Registration to do business in 
Pennsylvania under the provisions of Chapter 4 
of the Association Transactions Act. The street 
address in the association's jurisdiction of 
formation is 251 Little Falls Dr., Wilmington, 
DE 19808. The commercial registered office 
provider in PA is c/o: Corporation Service Co., 
and shall be deemed for venue and official 
publication purposes to be located in Dauphin 

County.                                                                                a9 
     

 
FICTITIOUS NAME 

NOTICES 
 
  NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that an 
Application for Registration of Fictitious Name 
was filed in the Department of State of the 
Commonwealth of Pennsylvania on March 09, 
2021 for RE/MAX CONNECTION REALTY 
at 140 Bridgeton Pike Mantua, NJ 08051. The 
entity interested in such business is Mantua Real 
Estate Co., LLC whose Commercial Registered 
Office provider is Penncorp Service Group, Inc. 
in Dauphin county. This was filed in accordance 
with 54 Pa.C.S. 311.                                                      a9 
     

 
NAME CHANGE 

NOTICES 
 

IN THE COURT OF COMMON PLEAS 
OF DAUPHIN COUNTY 

PENNSYLVANIA 
 

DOCKET NO: 2020-CV-09648-NC  
 

PETITION FOR CHANGE OF NAME  
 

NOTICE 
 
  NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that on January 
19, 2021 the Petition of Troy Dwayne Chester 
was filed in the above named court, requesting a 
decree to change his name from Troy Dwayne 
Chester to Troy Dwayne Green, Jr.  
  The Court has fixed at Wednesday, April 21, 
2021 at 9:00 a.m. in Courtroom No. 8, 5th Floor, 
Dauphin County Courthouse, 101 Market Street, 
Harrisburg, PA 17101 as the time and place for 
the hearing on said Petition, when and where all 
persons interested may appear and show cause if 
any they have, why the prayer of the said 
Petition should not be granted.                                 a9 
     
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



 

IN THE COURT OF COMMON PLEAS 
OF DAUPHIN COUNTY 

PENNSYLVANIA 
 

DOCKET NO: 2021-CV-00856-NC 
 

PETITION FOR CHANGE OF NAME  
 

NOTICE 
 
  NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that on 
February 25, 2021 the Petition of Talia Rose 
Miller was filed in the above named court, 
requesting a decree to change her name from 
Talia Rose Miller to Asher Reid Miller. 
  The Court has fixed Wednesday, April 21, 
2021 at 9:00am in Courtroom No. 8, 5th Floor, 
Dauphin County Courthouse, 101 Market Street, 
Harrisburg, PA 17101 as the time and place for 
the hearing on said Petition, when and where all 
persons interested may appear and show cause if 
any they have, why the prayer of the said 
Petition should not be granted.                                 a9 
 




